
From: Danny Varat
To: Kevin L. Bryant <KevinBryant@scstatehouse.gov>

Date: 12/20/2017 2:26:04 PM
Subject: FW: Cost Accounting Forms - Third Quarter

Attachments: CAFs - Third Quarter 2017.pdf

 
 

From: Weis, Jeremy John [mailto:jweis@sled.sc.gov] 
 
Sent: Thursday, December 14, 2017 8:02 PM
 
To: Danny Varat 
Subject: Cost Accounting Forms - Third Quarter
 
Danny
 
The cost accounting forms for the Third Quarter 2017 are attached. Please let me know if any changes need to be made. 
Upon your approval, I will send them on to the appropriate agencies for billing. Thanks.
 
SLED
$1048.36
DPS
$49.33
Total
$1097.69
 
S/A Jeremy Weis
Executive Protection Unit
South Carolina Law Enforcement Division
4400 Broad River Road
Columbia, SC 29210
Main - 803-737-9000
Mobile - 803-260-0848
Email - jweis@sled.sc.gov
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