From: Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov>
To: Robert Faturechi <Robert.Faturechi@propublica.org>
CC: Pisarik, Holly <HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov>
Adams, Chaney <ChaneyAdams@gov.sc.gov>
Date:  1/28/2016 3:25:45 PM
Subject:  RE: Cost Letter

Robert,

To ensure timely and confirmed delivery, the first batch was mailed via FedEx, rather than by U.S. post, on Tuesday,
January 26th, the date of receipt of payment. | was assured that the package would arrive to you by Friday, January
29th,

Compilation of the second batch was completed today. To expedite the process, we can tell you in advance that the
total cost for the second batch will be $10.50, the official cost determination letter of which will be emailed to you
tomorrow.

If you have any other questions, please let us know.
Sincerely,

Rebecca

From: Robert Faturechi [mailto:Robert.Faturechi@propublica.org]
Sent: Thursday, January 28, 2016 1:04 PM

To: Schimsa, Rebecca

Cc: Pisarik, Holly; Adams, Chaney

Subject: RE: Cost Letter

Hi all,

Still waiting on the first package, but I'm writing to check in about the last installment. You all said last month and earlier
this week that it would be finished in January. Tomorrow is the last business day in January. When you all have the final
cost, please let me know so | can send a check.

Thanks again for your help.
Robert

Robert Faturechi

Reporter, ProPublica

Desk: 917-512-0216

Cell: 213-271-7217
robert.faturechi@propublica.org
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