Danny Varat <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov>
Catherine McNicollCatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov
1/18/2018 12:02:41 PM

Re: Travel

| received this.

Hi Danny —
Attached is the invoice for the Majority Makers at the end of February.

| spoke with Deborah and would recommend speaking with your legal team prior to submitting this to the state for payment,
as this is a Political event.

All the best
Devon

Miss Devon Gallagher

Director of Events

Republican State Leadership Committee
202-448-8791 | Desk

570-401-4378 | Cell

From: Catherine McNicoll

Sent: Wednesday, January 17, 2018 3:30 PM
To: Danny Varat

Cc: Deborah Aiken

Subject: RE: Travel

Best Regards,

Catherine McNicoll

Director of Legal & Legidlative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicol | @SCSatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)

From: Danny Varat

Sent: Wednesday, January 17, 2018 7:12 AM
To: Catherine McNicoll

Subject: Travel

Who handles our travel? I'd like to attend this.

http://www.cvent.com/events/majority-makers-staff-retreat-2018/agenda-
5903240961d84fdd89147b1f36da3b4f.aspx
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