
From: Zach Pippin <zpippin@gmail.com>
To: SC Flood Fundscfloodfund@yourfoundation.org
CC: Cherise ArrendaleCherise@yourfoundation.org

JoAnn TurnquistJoAnn@yourfoundation.org
Pisarik, HollyHollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov

Date: 12/27/2015 2:26:56 PM
Subject: Re: One SC Logo

Attachments: One SC Logo w Background.ai
One SC Logo.ai
One-SC-Logo-for-print.png
One-SC-Logo-w-Background-for-print.png

Here are the art files for both versions of the logo plus a JPEG and
 
PNG version.
 

On Wed, Dec 23, 2015 at 3:18 PM, SC Flood Fund
 
<scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org> wrote:
 
> No worries! I won't be back to the office until Monday.
 
>
 
> Have a safe trip!
 
>
 
> Sent from Outlook Mobile
 
>
 
> _____________________________
 
> From: Gmail <zpippin@gmail.com>
 
> Sent: Wednesday, December 23, 2015 3:17 PM
 
> Subject: Re: One SC Logo
 
> To: SC Flood Fund <scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org>
 
> Cc: Cherise Arrendale <cherise@yourfoundation.org>, JoAnn Turnquist
 
> <joann@yourfoundation.org>, Pisarik, Holly <hollypisarik@gov.sc.gov>
 
>
 
>
 
>
 
> Sorry. I'm in Haiti right now. I'll be back late tomorrow night and can get
 
> you one then.
 
>
 
> Zach Pippin
 
> Sent from my iPhone
 
>
 
> On Dec 23, 2015, at 12:32, SC Flood Fund < scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org>
 
> wrote:
 
>
 
> Hi Zach,
 
>
 
> As soon as possible we'd love to have a high res version of the One SC logo.
 
> Unfortunately the version we have right now is not sufficient for printing.
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>
 
> Thanks and hope you have a Merry Christmas!
 
> Dana
 
>
 
> Sent from Outlook Mobile
 
>
 
> _____________________________
 
> From: SC Flood Fund < scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org>
 
> Sent: Friday, December 18, 2015 2:49 PM
 
> Subject: One SC Logo
 
> To: < zpippin@gmail.com>
 
> Cc: Cherise Arrendale < cherise@yourfoundation.org>
 
>
 
>
 
> Hello Zach,
 
>
 
>
 
>
 
> Do you have a high resolution logo for the One SC Fund? We need a logo with
 
> high res to print thank you cards. If you can, please send that to me.
 
>
 
>
 
>
 
> Thanks!
 
>
 
>
 
>
 
> Dana Bruce Fulmer
 
>
 
> SC Flood Relief Fund
 
>
 
> Central Carolina Community Foundation
 
>
 
> P. 803.254.5601
 
>
 
> F. 803.799.6663
 
>
 
>
 
>
 
>
 
>
 
>
 
>



