
From: Kester, Tony
To: Rivers, Denise <riversd@aging.sc.gov>

Date: 6/9/2014 3:42:33 PM
Subject: RE: VDHCBS update

Thank you.

Tony Kester
Aging Director
South Carolina Lieutenant Governor's Office on Aging
1301 Gervais Street, Suite 350
Columbia, SC 29201
Phone 803-734-9910, Fax 803-734-9886
kester@aging.sc.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This electronic email may contain information that is privileged, confidential, and/or otherwise protected from
disclosure to anyone other than its intended recipient(s). Any dissemination or use of this electronic mail or its contents by persons other than the 
intended recipient(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply email so 
that we may correct our internal records. Please then delete the original message.

From: Rivers, Denise
Sent: Monday, June 09, 2014 3:05 PM
To: Kester, Tony
Subject: VDHCBS update

Tony - Quick update

Gave Quincy electronic deposit detail for $18,947.37 today (all from Chas.)

Sent Glenn and Leigh (Dorn) an email requesting remainder of Jan. and Feb. payments as well as March and April
Requested a meeting to see if we can streamline the process

Had sent email to Mr. Isaacks (Chas.) thanking them for prompt payment (paid through April) and asking for a status 
update on whether they are going to continue the program or not. Mr. Isaacks replied that he has received no word 
from Central office and that the 11 veterans that are currently being served will remain in the program until he hears 
something from VACO.

Denise
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