
From: Danny Varat <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov>
To: Catherine McNicollCatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov

Broome, Darryldbroome@aging.sc.gov
Date: 3/19/2018 11:11:35 AM

Subject: Re: Hospice

​Darryl and I have talked about this. And, don't be sorry.


From: Catherine McNicoll
 
Sent: Monday, March 19, 2018 11:08 AM
 
To: Danny Varat; Broome, Darryl
 
Subject: RE: Hospice 
 
Again just following up. Sorry to be a bother.
 
Best Regards,
Catherine McNicoll
Director of Legal & Legislative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicoll@SCStatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)
 
From: Catherine McNicoll 
 
Sent: Wednesday, March 14, 2018 2:29 PM
 
To: Danny Varat ; Broome, Darryl 
Subject: RE: Hospice
 
Just want to follow up and see where we are on this information.
 
Best Regards,
Catherine McNicoll
Director of Legal & Legislative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicoll@SCStatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)
 
From: Danny Varat 
 
Sent: Thursday, March 08, 2018 7:17 PM
 
To: Broome, Darryl <dbroome@aging.sc.gov>
 
Cc: Catherine McNicoll <CatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov>
 
Subject: Fw: Hospice
 
Please ask someone to gather some facts on this for LG
 

Sent using OWA for iPhone

From: Kevin L. Bryant
 
Sent: Thursday, March 8, 2018 4:20:55 PM
 
To: Catherine McNicoll; Danny Varat
 
Subject: Hospice 
 
Can you find out how Hospice Reimbursement works? Per day, fee each service or daily fee. 
 

I’m trying to find out if hospice care is more profitable if the patient passes on quicklyor not. 
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Sent using OWA for iPhone


