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Brenda James

From: sherry hipp <sherryhipp@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 26, 2013 2:17 PM
To: Brenda James

Subject: FOI Request

Ms James,

Please provide me a CD containing all of the most current SC SNF cost reports.

To save the postage I will be happy to pick up the CD at your office on Main St. Please contact me at 803-240-
7355 when CD is available.

Thank you,

Sherry Hipp RECEIVED
FEB 27 2013

Depariment of Health & Human Services
OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR



Anthony E. Kecke Director’
Nikki R. Haleye Governor

( South Carolina Departmentof. 22
) -Health & Human Services

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours
Pages copied at $.10 per page “ Pages
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages

Shipping and Handling Costs

Other costs associated with the FOIA request:

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:
Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

$___
.
__
S
$

$__

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services

Post Office Box 8297 -

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297 -
Please contact should you have any
questions.
Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P.O. Box 8206 « Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-3202 « Fax (803) 255-8235



Sent: Monday, March 04, 2013 8:35 AM
To: Brenda James

Cc: chasemgray@gmail.com 3 &W//w‘d/
Subject: FW: FOIA Request (/[\,L Oam /

Brehda James
rom: isa Jackson oke LOE % M
F Lisa Jack % /0 MI:ZZ

Good morning Chase,
| would be happy to honor your FOIA request but it must first be submitted to Brenda James. | have done it as a courtesy
for you this time but in the future please submit all further request to Brenda James.

Thanking you in advance Chase, 3/ 11?//3
o O Cirtlrat._Slookion

SC Department of Health and Human Services ‘ i "l("Z)
. . . O y 6,&6/

Division of Longterm Care Reimbursement
| L w4 { o9 3 “

Direct Line (803} 898-2081
From: Chase Gray [mailto:chasemgray@gmail.com] ’ﬂ: 3
Sent: Sunday, March 03, 2013 10:41 PM LD : M -
To: Lisa Jackson 8

Subject: FOIA Request

Hello,

I would like to request an extract for the latest submitted SNF cost reports for the entire state. In the past this
was sent to me on a single CD/DVD. I believe it was an Access database but [ may be mistaken.
Please let me know if there are any costs over $50.

Chase Gray

555 W Middlefield Rd. Apt N107
Mountain View, CA 94043
Thanks,

Chase Gray



il 3
Brenda James < e ? & ‘2
From: Linda Boyer _

Sent: Tuesday, March 12, 2013 9:50 AM

To: Lauren Young; Brenda James

Cc: Lisa Jackson; Marie Brown; Beth Hutto; Jeff Saxon
Subject: RE: FOIA # 263 Completed

Attachments: FOIA 263 Response Letter.pdf; FOIA 263 _ Shealy.pdf

Good Morning All,

Attached is the final response letter for FOIA #263. I called Sherry Hipp this morning and she is going to come
by today to pick up the SNF cost reports (on a CD) and final response letter. Please close your files
accordingly.

Thank You!

SC Dept of Health & Human Services
Office of General Counsel

1801 Main Street

Columbia, SC 29201

Phone: (803) 898-2669

Fax: (803) 255-8210

Email: boyer@scdhhs.gov

“Forgiving someone doesn’t make them right, it makes you free”
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March 12, 2013

Ms. Sherry Hipp

Ms. Hipp,

This is in response to your request for information from the South Carolina Department
of Health and Human Services (DHHS) pursuant to the South Carolina Freedom of
Information Act (FOIA) dated February 26, 2013 and received by DHHS on February 27,
2013. Enclosed is a CD with the information requested.

Our expense for extracting this information is ten and 00/100 dollars ($10.00). Please
make the check payable to the Department of Health and Human Services and send it to:

Department of Health and Human Services
Department of Receivables

Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, SC 29202-8297

Thank you for your request. If you have any questions, you may contact Ms. Beth Hutto,
Deputy Director and Chief Financial Officer, at (803) 898-2955.

Sincerely,

NP

Shealy Reibold
Assistant General Counsel

SR/Ib

Enclosures



