
From: Veldran, Katherine
To: Kelly Barbrey <KBarbrey@Columbiaauthority.com>

Mottel, Haley <HaleyMottel@gov.sc.gov>
'Lee Ann Kornegay' <lakornegay@gmail.com>
Kelsey Carmichael <KCarmichael@Columbiaauthority.com>

Date: 9/8/2015 11:18:10 AM

Subject: RE: Invoice-Gov. Carolighting 2014.pdf

When available please send the word version of last year's program.
Thanks, KV

-----Original Message-----
From: Kelly Barbrey [mailto:KBarbrey@Columbiaauthority.com]
Sent: Tuesday, September 08, 2015 9:19 AM
To: Veldran, Katherine; Mottel, Haley; 'Lee Ann Kornegay'; Kelsey Carmichael
Subject: Invoice-Gov. Carolighting 2014.pdf

Attached please find the invoice from Sam Holland for photography last year. Total was $750.
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