7/7/2016 5:06:12 PM
Re: FOIA Payment - Remaining Balance

Received. Thanks.

On Thu, Jul 7, 2016 at 5:05 PM, Schimsa, Rebecca < > wrote:
Jamie,

Please see attached.

Thank you,

Rebecca

Rebecca S. Schimsa
Deputy Legal Counsel
Office of Governor Nikki R. Haley

O: | C:

Jamie Self

Government reporter

The State, Columbia

Covering: Gov. Nikki Haley, S.C. GOP & K-12 education
@jamiemself

office: 803-771-8658
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