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‘FBrenda James - Follow-up: Fwd: Open _»moo_,mnmmncmmn 1172: Thomson Medstat Wmummﬂ

RECEIVE])

From: Michele McCune <michele.mccune@yahoo.com>

To: <kostbr@dhhs.state.sc.us> JUN 21 2007
Date: 6/21/2007 12:34 pm D ,
Subject: Follow-up: Fwd: Open Records Request 1172: Thomson Medstat mﬁ_w_m__mwmu mﬁ w._.p..Igmm mﬂmﬂzﬂ.ﬁw
Hello,

Please provide status on the below request, any information would be appreciated. Please note below a
new mailing address for shipping of information:

Michele McCune

213 Thomas Park Drive

Hutto, TX 78634

Thank you,
Michele McCune

Michele McCune <michele.mecune@yahoo.com> wrote:
Date: Wed, 30 May 2007 12:43:34 -0700 (PDT)

From: Michele McCune <michele.mccune@yahoo.com>

Subject: Open Records Request 1172: Thomson Medstat

To: kostbr@dhhs.state.sc.us

Hello,

In accordance with South Carolina Freedom of Information Act, | would like to receive a copy of the
winning proposal and final contract with Thomson Medstat that was awarded in approximately August
2005 to provide a healthcare decision support system for the South Carolina Department of Health and
Human Services (DHHS).

. Receiving these documents in an electronic version (via email) would be the preferred method for
reciept. Regardless of information being emailed, please mail an electronic version on CD-Rom
(preferred) or a printed version of all requested documents to the address listed below.

Michele McCune
3797 East Palm Valley Blvd
Round Rock, Texas 78664

If the response to this inquiry is expected to cost more than $100, then please notify me beforehand of
the estimated cost before proceeding.

Your cooperation in this effort is appreciated and please feel free to contact me if any questions. If |
have not reached the correct party in order to submit this open records request please email back. Any
information that you could provide on the correct party to contact would be appreciated.

Thank you,
Michele McCune
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State of South aroling
Bepartment of Health and Human Jerbices

Mark Sanford Robert M. Kerr
‘Govemnor Director

TO:
FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour ‘Hours
Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages
Pages faxed at $.20 per page - Pages

Shipping and Handling Costs

Other costs associated with the FOIA request:

@ P 4 O P &

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



_ Byron Roberts - Freedom of information Act Request _ ‘ VZi _.ummmn‘_

AN AT

From: Byron Roberts i
To: michele.mccune@yahoo.com

Date: 7/10/2007 12:05:42 PM

Subject: Freedom of Information Act Request

Dear Ms: McCune:

This is in response to your request for a copy of the winning proposal and final contract with Thomson
Medstat that was awarded in approximately August 2005. In South Carolina, the "final contract” is the
RFP documents and the winning vendor's proposal. Our agency has the RFP, amendments to the RFP,
and an unredacted copy of the Thomson Medstat's proposal. Attached please find the RFP documents. |
am making efforts to obtain a redacted copy (with proprietary information removed) of Medstat's proposal
from -our state procurement office. If the cost to prepare the redacted proposal is more than $100, I'll let
you know the estimated cost before proceeding.

Thanks for your request.

Byron R. Roberis
Assistant General Counsel



