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Brenda James
-

From: Debra Myers

Sent: Wednesday, November 14, 2012 9:05 AM
To: Brenda James

Cc: Lisa Jackson

Subject: FW: Cost report request

Brenda,

Please log FOIA request.

Debra Myers

SC Department of Health and Human Services
Direct Line (803) 898-2883

Fax Line {803) 255-8228

From: Chase Pursley [mailto:chasepvg@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, November 14, 2012 8:00 AM

To: Brandy Gilbert; Debra Myers
Subject: Cost report request

Hi - I'm not sure who's handling cost report requests these days so I sent it to both of you : )

I need to order a copy of the most recently available 12 month period of cost reports for the following facilities:

Riverside Health & Rehab

2375 Baker Hospital Blvd

North Charleston, SC 29405
License/Certification: #NCF-0870

NHC HealthCare Of Garden City
9405 Highway 17 Bypass
Murrells Inlet, SC 29576
License/Certification: #NCF-0825

Prince George HealthCare Center
901 Maple St

Georgetown, SC 29440
License/Certification: #NCF-0930

Georgetown Healthcare & Rehab
2715 S Island Rd

Georgetown, SC 29440
License/Certification: #NCF-0633

Thank you as always!



Chase Pursley, Appraiser
Province Consulting Group
5800 Mountain Creek Road
Atlanta, Georgia 30328

(678) 632-6817 phone
(678) 607-6443 fax




'( South Carolina Departmentof & Anthony E. Kecke Director
) Health & H uman Se rvices Nikki R. Haleye Governor

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours $

Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages $_

Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages $ '

Shipping and Handling Costs $

Other costs associated with the FOIA request: $_
Total Amou;\t Due SCDHHS: $___

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs
South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services

Post Office Box 8297
Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297 -

Please contact should you have any
guestions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P.0. Box 8206 » Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-3202 « Fax (803) 255-8235



Brenda James bg FF/?% J

From: Lauren Young

Sent: Tuesday, January 08, 2013 12:30 PM

To: Brenda James

Subject: FW: Cost report Request Log Letter 000146

Attachments: Riverside Health.pdf; NHC Garden.pdf; Prince George.pdf; Georgetown Healthcare.pdf
FYI

From: Lauren Young

Sent: Friday, November 16, 2012 11:28 AM

To: Brenda James

Subject: FW: Cost report Request Log Letter 000146

Brenda—

The emails below satisfy the FOIA request for log letter 000146. The four attachad cost reports were all 40 pages or
larger, which was too much to print.

Thanks

From: Lisa Jackson

Sent: Thursday, November 15, 2012 1:32 PM

To: Janet Bell; Brenda James

Cc: Debra Myers; Louis Krause; Ruth Johnson; Lauren Young
Subject: FW: RE: Cost report Request

Here is the e-mail that was sent to clear FOIA Request #146 from your logs. Since the information was emailed, there
was no charge! If you need anything else, just let me know.

Thanks,
e O Cotttiet., Seloon
Auditor Il

£C Departraent of Health ond Human Services
Division of Longierm Care Reimbursement
Direct Line (803) 898-2081

From: Lisa Jackson

Sent: Thursday, November 15, 2012 1:27 PM
To: 'chasepvg@gmail.com’

Subject: RE: Cost report Request

Mr. Pursley,



Attached are the cost reports that you requested through Freedom Of Information. If you need anything else, please let
me know.

| am now the primary contact for such request!

e O Cortletiret.. Srhton,

Auditor 1l

SC Department of Health and Human Services
Division of Longterm Care Reimbursement
Direct Line {803) 898-2081



