
From: Finance Help, Aging <financehelp@aging.sc.gov> 
To: Wolf, Anne <awolf@aging.sc.gov>
CC: Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>

Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov>
Date: 10/22/2014 8:27:58 AM

Subject: FW: Waccamaw Insurance PRF for September 2014 
Attachments: Waccamaw ICARE Invoice for September 2014.pdf

Please review the attached PRF(s) for your programs. The PRFs can also be found on the groupshare
(K:\\PSA\\PRFs\\FY15\\Waccamaw).
Please send an email once approved or rejected stating reason for rejection. Please respond within three (3) business 
days.

From: Kimberly Harmon [mailto:kharmon@wrcog.org]
Sent: Monday, October 20, 2014 1:25 PM
To: Finance Help, Aging
Subject: Waccamaw Insurance PRF for September 2014

Attached is the insurance PRF for September 2014
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Kimberly Harmon
Aging Director
(O) 843.546.8502 ext. 1259
(F) 843.527.2302
kharmon@wrcog.org | www.wrcog.org

This e-mail, in its entirety and including all attachments, is intended solely for the use of the person or entity to whom it is addressed and may contain sensitive 
information which is privileged, confidential, and the disclosure of which is governed by applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby 

notified that disclosing, distributing, copying, or taking any action in relation to this e-mail is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If you have received this e-mail in error, 
please notify the sender immediately and destroy the related message and any attachments.

WARNING: All e-mail correspondence to and from this address may be subject to public disclosure under the South Carolina Freedom of Information Act (FOIA),
§30-410 SC Code of Laws
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