
From: Pisarik, Holly
To: Patel, Swati <SwatiPatel@gov.sc.gov>

Date: 1/4/2016 12:14:08 PM
Subject: FW:

Attachments: 2015-12-31 Litig. Retention Agr. (MOX) (FINAL).pdf
2015-12-31 Litig. Retention Agr. (MOX) (FINAL).docx

Here are the highlights:
 
Scope: Legal representation arising from the U.S Department of Energy’s failure to meet statutory milestones for the 
disposition of radioactive material at the Savannah River Site (would need to be broadened if consider injunction)
 
Term: Through Jan 4, 2019
 
Payment for Suit Brought by AG:

-          No compensation of any kind for any services rendered unless the State receives a settlement or judgment in 
connection with litigation.

-          Compensated from litigation’s gross recovery less AG’s reimbursement for costs and expenses, Special 
Counsel’s reimbursement for costs and expenses, and hourly rate to Special Counsel in the event of a suit 
against the State.

-          After deductions, compensated at following percentages: First 0 – 25 million – 21%; 25.01 – 50 million – 18%; 
50.01 to 75 million – 15%; 75.01 – 100 million – 13% (percentages go up in the event of an appeal)

-          In the event of an early settlement, fees are one-half of the above percentages
 
Payment in the event State is sued:

-          Paid at an hourly rate to defend the suit out of litigation proceeds ($190-$100 per hour depending on years 
of experience)

 
Special Counsel Expenses:

-          Special Counsel advances all costs, expenses and disbursements and is to be reimbursed out of litigation’s 
recovery

     
 
From: Bob Cook [mailto:BCook@scag.gov] 

Sent: Monday, January 04, 2016 11:06 AM

To: Patel, Swati; Pisarik, Holly

Subject: FW:
 
Here is our agreed to Retention Agreement for the MOX case for your review. Bob
 
Robert D. Cook
Solicitor General
S.C. Attorney General’s Office
P.O. Box 11549
Columbia, S.C. 29211
P: 803-734-3736
F: 803-734-3524
 
From: Randy Lowell [mailto:RLowell@Willoughbyhoefer.com] 

Sent: Monday, January 04, 2016 9:41 AM

To: Bob Cook

Subject:
 
 

mailto:Pisarik,%20Holly
mailto:SwatiPatel@gov.sc.gov


 
Randolph R. Lowell, Esquire
Willoughby & Hoefer, P.A.
(930 Richland Street)
Post Office Box 8416
Columbia, South Carolina 29202 (29201)
Telephone #: (803) 252-3300
Facsimile #: (803) 256-8062
E-mail address: rlowell@willoughbyhoefer.com

Confidentiality Notice: The information contained in this transmittal, including any attachment, is privileged and confidential information and is 
intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed. If you are neither the intended recipient nor the employee or agent responsible for 
delivering this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying or distribution or the taking of any action in 
reliance on the contents of this transmittal is strictly prohibited. If you have received this transmittal in error, please contact the sender 
immediately by telephoning the sender at (803) 252-3300 and, also, please delete this transmittal from any computer or other data bank. Upon 
request, we will reimburse your reasonable costs of notifying us of a transmission error. Thank you.
 
IRS Circular 230 Disclosure: To ensure compliance with requirements imposed by the IRS, we inform you that any U.S. federal tax advice contained 
in this communication (including any attachments) is not intended or written to be used, and cannot be used, for the purpose of (i) avoiding 
penalties under the Internal Revenue Code or (ii) promoting, marketing or recommending to another party any transaction or matter addressed 
herein. This advice may not be forwarded (other than within the taxpayer to which it was sent) without our express written consent.  
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