From: Zavoras, Catherine <cZavoras@aging.sc.gov>
To: Finance Help, Aging <financehelp@aging.sc.gov>
CC: Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov>
Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>
Watson, Dale <dwatson@aging.sc.gov>
Date: 11/24/2014 4:02:03 PM
Subject:  RE: Central Midlands Services PRF for October 2014

Central Midlands has requested reimbursement for Legal Services. The units and charges appear correct; however,
Central Midlands has failed to file the required information including copies of their legal services contracts/MOAs,
outreach plan, methodology for assessing the need for services, plan for training staff, and the methodology that will
be used for screening and targeting the correct populations and issues. These are all requirements of the Older
Americans Act and are reflected in ther Legal Assistance Development Standards. Until the appropriate information
is provided, | respectfully disapprove any payment for legal services for this region.

Catherine S. Zavoras

State Legal Services Developer

South Carolina Lieutenant Governor's Office on Aging
Office of the State Long Term Care Ombudsman
1301 Gervais Street, Suite 350

Columbia, SC 29201

Phone 803-734-9983, Fax 803-734-9988
czavoras@aging.sc.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This electronic email may contain information that is privileged, confidential, and/or otherwise protected from
disclosure to anyone other than its intended recipient(s). Any dissemination or use of this electronic mail or its contents by persons other than the
intended recipient(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply email so
that we may correct our internal records. Please then delete the original message.

From: Finance Help, Aging

Sent: Friday, November 21, 2014 2:39 PM

To: Van Cleave, Jennifer; Pondy, Kevin; Rivers, Denise; Ford, Elizabeth; Wolf, Anne; Zavoras, Catherine; Shavo, Katherine
Cc: Ellison, Ruchelle; Kester, Tony

Subject: FW: Central Midlands Services PRF for October 2014

Please review the attached PRF(s) for your programs. The PRFs can also be found on the groupshare
(K:N\PSA\\PRFs\\FY15\\Central Midlands).

Please send an email once approved or rejected stating reason for rejection. Please respond ASAP.

From: Malia Ropel [mailto:mropel@centralmidlands.org]
Sent: Friday, November 21, 2014 2:17 PM

To: Finance Help, Aging

Cc: Ben Mauldin; Reginald Simmons; Cindy Curtis
Subject: Central Midlands Services PRF for October 2014

Attached is the services PRF for October.
We are using year-to-date amounts for respite services since we are requesting money twice per month.

Malia Ropel
Finance Director
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Central Midlands Council of Governments
236 Stoneridge Drive

Columbia, SC 29210

Phone: 803-744-5159

Fax: 803-929-2611

This e-mail, in its entirety and including all attachments, is intended solely for the use of the person or entity to whom it is
addressed and may contain sensitive information which is privileged, confidential, and the disclosure of which is govermed by
applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that disclosing, distributing, copying, or taking
any action in relation fto this e-mail is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If you have received this e-mail in error, please notify the
sender immediately and destroy the related message and any attachments.

WARNING: All e-mail correspondence to and from this address may be subject to public disclosure under the South Carolina
Freedom of Information Act (FOIA), §30-410 SC Code of Laws.



