Kester, Tony

'Steve Pelissier' <pelissier@scacog.org>
6/11/2013 4:46:54 PM

RE: ACOG Appalachian AAA Invoice 14

Me too.

From: Steve Pelissier [mailto:pelissier@scacog.org]
Sent: Tuesday, June 11, 2013 4:39 PM

To: Kester, Tony

Subject: RE: ACOG Appalachian AAA Invoice 14

Thanks Tony.
I'm anxious to hear what comes out of your meeting tomorrow.

Steve

From: Kester, Tony [mailto:kester@aging.sc.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, June 11, 2013 4:37 PM

To: Steve Pelissier

Subject: RE: ACOG Appalachian AAA Invoice 14

Steve,

You are fine. | have a meeting with the Lt. Governor in the morning which may impact all providers, or not. | will
know after lunch.

Tony

From: Steve Pelissier [mailto:pelissier@scacog.org]
Sent: Tuesday, June 11, 2013 2:50 PM

To: Kester, Tony

Subject: ACOG Appalachian AAA Invoice 14

Tony:

It is my understanding that Carolyn, from my office, and Betsy got the amount straight for Senior Action invoicing, as
well as all of our other expenses, late last week and that Carolyn sent an invoice just before 5:00 Thursday afternoon.

When you and | talked last week, you mentioned that once it came in, you would review and approve it Monday
morning - assuming everything was correct.

I'm just checking in to make sure that everything was correct and it included the required documentation. If we do
need to do something else, or if you require additional documentation, please let me know.

Thank you for your help with this matter.

Steve
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