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Linda Malone - Fwd: LEA fiscal data 05-06

From: Debbie Strait

To: Jeff Stensland

Date: 7/10/2006 12:03:50 PM
Subject: Fwd: LEA fiscal data 05-06

Hi Jeff, | received this FOIA request from Loretta Price. FYI ...Loretta is an independent consultant. My
understanding is that she is desiring to represent School Districts in billing and reimbursement areas. She
is requesting LEA MMIS data in a format that we typically refer to as "Cost Settlement Reports”.

It is available at this time based on your approval.

Thanks, Debbie

>>> "Loretta Price" <lpricev8@sc.rr.com> 7/5/2006 3:56 PM >>>

Dear Mrs.Strait;

Please accept this email as a FOIA request to receive 2005-06 fiscal data for Local Education Agencies
receiving Medicaid School Based Services reimbursements. Feel free to contact me at 3 Sesqui Court,
Columbia, South Carolina 29223, 803-397-9045 or |pricev8@sc.rr.com if you have questions.

Thank you,

Loretta Price.



State of South Carolina

Bepartment of Health and Himum Serfrices
Mark Sanford Robert M. Kerr
Govemor Director

TO:
FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours
Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages

Shipping and Handling Costs

Other costs associated with the FOIA request:

¥ P &£ &H &

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8355

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8355

Please contact should you have
any questions.

Signature Date:
Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 898-4515

C:\tmp\FOIAblankinvoice2.doc



Elizabeth Hutto - Log ltem #000057 (FOIA Request) Page 1|

——— i ?\
From: Debbie Strait % %AU N
To: Elizabeth Hutto
Date: 7/12/2006 10:51:56 AM
Subject: Log Item #000057 (FOIA Request) Q \v Qb
Hi Faye. 3\,\ N4

| have completed the FOIA request referenced above. Loretta Price picked up the requested information
on 7/12. Please note | did not complete a memo/invoice as the information she had asked for was a
second copy of data we had on hand, | spent very little time pulling the information together, and there
were no faxing or shipping charges.

Do you need the FOIA package back? Thanks, Debbie

CC: Karen Maine



