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From: Brandy Putnam

To: Brenda James; Elizabeth Hutto; Karen Maine
Date: 12/15/2010 4:14 PM

Subject: Fwd: Re: Cost reports for appraisal - Sumter

Please log this FOIA request!

Brandy Putnam

Department of Health and Human Services
Phone Number (803)-898-1016

Fax Number (803)-255-8228

>>> Debra Myers 12/15/2010 4:07 PM >>>
Your request will be sent to the appropriate person to process as a freedom of information request.

>>> Chase Pursley <chasepv
Hello Debbie,

mail.com> 12/15/10 3:45 PM >>>

My company, Province Consulting Group, has ordered cost reports with you in
the past. We're working on a real estate appraisal for a SNF and need cost
reports for the following facilities:

1. HOPEWELL HEALTHCARE CENTER

1761 PINEWOOD ROADSUMTER, SC 29154
(803) 481-8591

License/Certification: #NCF-0745

2.NHC HEALTHCARE - SUMTER
1018 N GUIGNARDSUMTER, SC 29150
License/Certification: #NCF-0471

3. Sumter East Health & Rehab Center
880 Carolina Ave

PO Box 1526

Sumter, SC 29150
License/Certification: #NCF-0919

4. A Sam Karesh Long Term Care Center
1315 Roberts StCamden, SC 29020
License/Certification: #NCF-0313Skilled Nursing Facility

5. Springdale HealthCare Center
146 Battleship RdCamden, SC 29020
License/Certification: #NCF-0925Skilled Nursing Facility

Thanks for your help and please let me know if you need any more data.

Chase Pursley, Appraiser
Province Consulting Group
5800 Mountain Creek Road
Atlanta, Georgia 30328

(404) 394-5279 cell
(B66) 317-6888 fax
Skype: MedProp

Email: chasepv mail.com
Web: www.provincevaluation.com
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From: Karen Maine

To: Elizabeth Hutto

Date: 1/12/2011 2:17 PM

Subject: Fwd: Cost reports - urgent - Sumter

Karen A. Maine, Auditor III
Ancillary/Acute Care Reimbursements
(803) 898-1040
MAINEK@scdhhs.gov

>>> Chase Pursley <chasepvg@gmail.com> 1/10/2011 2:39 PM >>>
Debbie,

Hi, I'm having a difficult time getting in contact with Brandy Putnam about
the Sumter area SNF cost reports I ordered. I was under the impression that
these were going to be in early last week.

Our company is working on an appraisal (that is now past due) that the bank
needs in order to close a loan. The last thing we have to finish with our
appraisal is dependent upon these cost reports.

Please contact me as soon as you can. I need to find out when I can expect
the cost reports. We would prefer a CD, but at this point, anything would
do including fax.

Our company FedEx number is: 280214663

Thanks for understanding!

Chase Pursley, Appraiser
Province Consulting Group
5800 Mountain Creek Road
Atlanta, Georgia 30328

(404) 394-5279 cell
(866) 317-6888 fax
Skype: MedProp

Email: chasepv

mail.com
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From: Debra Myers

To: chase@pratchetsoftware.com; Brandy Putham u/
Date: 2/9/2011 5:13 AM ! _,N
Subject: Re: Fwd: FOIA Request 2009

Brandy, _/

Please resend a CD with the files requested in the October FOIA. VC @Y

Thanks

Debbie

>>> Chase Gray <chase@ratchetsoftware.com> 02/08/11 7:32 PM >>>
Hello,

| submitted this request in late October. The CD that arrived only
contained the database for a single facility. | paid the fee for the
request but only recently started working with the files and realized that
only one facilities' data is included.

Could | please have all of the files like | received in 2008. All of the
files should fit on one CD, so if that is possible then it would make
shipping easier.

Thanks,
Chase Gray

Name: Chase Gray

Address: 1640 Koulter Dr Columbia, SC 29210

Request: 2009 SC nursing facility cost reports in the digital format that
the facilities submit them in on a disk.

phone: 240-242-7364

«—--—---- Forwarded message -—-——--

From: Chase Gray <chase@ratchetsoftware.com>
Date: Tue, Oct 26, 2010 at 6:45 PM

Subject: FOIA Request 2009

To: myersdeb@scdhhs.gov

Hi,

| would like to submit a FOIA request for the 2009 SC cost reports submitted
by nursing facilities in the state. | would like these files on a disk in

the digital form that they are submitted to the state through the online
system. | have received these in the past as access databases. They were
sent on multiple CDs. If possible, could they be included on a single CD?

Name: Chase Gray

Address: 1640 Koulter Dr Columbia, SC 29210

Request: 2009 SC nursing facility cost reports in the digital format that
the facilities submit them in on a disk.

phone: 240-242-7364
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Thanks!

Chase Gray



