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Brenda James

“

From: SCDHHS MMIS-MITA

Sent: Friday, February 22, 2013 8:58 AM

To: Brenda James

Cc: Gordie Neff

Subject: FW: New 2013 SC-FOIA Request - MMIS RFI # 58
Brenda,

We received a FOIA request. Vicki said that I should forward it to you to initiate the response process.

Gordie

From: FOIA GROUP [foia@foia.com]

Sent: Friday, February 15, 2013 5:20 AM

To: shanvey@itmo.sc.gov; SCDHHS MMIS-MITA; Alicia Jacobs
Subject: RE: New 2013 SC-FOIA Request - MMIS RFI # 5B

Good morning, under the provisions of the South Carolina Freedom of Information Act, I
hereby request a copy of the following documents identified to MMIS RFI # 5B:

1) All vendor proposals submitted in response to the Replacement MMIS RFI # 5B.

If you have any questions please contact me at foia@foia.com. I agree to pay reasonable foia
fees, however, please notify me if these fees exceed $55.00 for approval. Thanks, --- Rose
Santos, ¢/o FOIA Group, Inc., P.O. Box 368, Depew, New York, 14043 Tel: (716) 608-0800,
ext 502.
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TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours $

Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages $_

Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages $_

Shipping and Handling Costs $_

Other costs associated with the FOIA request: $_
Total Amou;lt Due SCDHHS: $_

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any
questions.

Signature ' Date:

Finance and Administration
P.O. Box 8206 » Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8206
{803) 898-3202 » Fax (803) 255-8235
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March 5, 2013
Rose Santos
c/o FOIA Group, Inc.
P.O. Box 368

Depew, New York 14043

Ms. Santos,

You made a request under the South Carolina Freedom of Information Act (FOIA) on
February 15, 2013. Enclosed are the requested vendor responses received by the State to
Replacement MMIS Requests for Information 5B.

The Department received 13 responses to the RFI 5B, and some responses contained
information marked proprietary and confidential by the respondent. In accordance with
the South Carolina Code of Laws, properly marked confidential information cannot be

released.

The following vendors responded to the RFTI:

Accuity — response included

Ayvision — response included

Blue Cross Blue Shield of South Carolina — response included
Compass — response included

Lexis-Nexis — response included

Magellan — response included

MAXIMUS - response included

MicroPact — response included

Navigant — response included

Noridian — response included

Optum - response included

Wipro-RAM Technologies — response included
Xerox — response included

Office of General Counsel
P.O. Box 8206 « Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2795 « Fax (803) 255-8210



Page 2
Ms. Santos

Our expense for reproducing and mailing this information is ten and 00/100 dollars
($10.00). Please make the check payable to the Department of Health and Human

Services and send it to:

Department of Health and Human Services
Department of Receivables

Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, SC 29202-8297

If you have further questions concerning this letter or its attachments, please contact

Gordie Neff at (803) 898-3042.

VJ/1b

Enclosures

Sincerely,

Assistant General Counsel



