Veldran, Katherine <KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov>
Monica McFarlandmonica@faninabox.com
4/29/2014 12:41:02 PM

Re: Update - jacket invoice

The payment will come from Lindsey Smulders with the Wasserman Media Group. | have sent them the invoice
when you forwarded it to me.

Katherine Veldran
Office of Governor Nikki Haley
803-767-7583

On Apr 29, 2014, at 11:18 AM, "Monica McFarland" <monica@faninabox.com> wrote:

Katherine - | would like to process payment on this. Do you have the payment information from
the below people?

Thank you,

Monica McFarland
Office Manager
Fan in a Box, LLC
855-837-7444

www . Faninabox.com

Think INSIDE the Box!

On 4/23/2014 12:30 PM, Veldran, Katherine wrote:

Please update the jacket invoice attached:

BILL TO:

Lindsey Smulders

Wasserman Media Group

77 King Street West, North Tower
Suite 4020, PO Box 250

Toronto, Ontario M5K 1J5

Thank you,
Katherine

Katherine F. Veldran

Director of Legislative Affairs | Office of Governor Nikki Haley
0:803-734-5124 | C: 803-767-7583
KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov
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