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June 11, 2012

Bryan Kost
P.0O. Box 1801
Columbia, SC 29202

Dear Bryan:

Sam G. Nicholson
sam@nicholsonrevell.com

Harry D. Reveil

harry@nicholsonrevell.com

Adam W. King
adam@nicholsonrevell.com

RECEIVED)
JUN 11 mem

Department of Health & _.._cae_ Services
OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR

Under the South Carolina Freedom of Information Act (SC Code Ann. mm..o-p-poy

I am requesting access to Medicaid facility cost reports and home office cost reports
filed by Orangeburg Nursing Home,/UniHealth Post-Acute Care Orangeburg, located at
755 Whitman Street, Orangeburg, South Carolina, 29115. I am requesting facility and
home office cost Teports for 2007, 2008, 2009, 2010, and 2011. The Medicaid number
for this facility is 0617NH. The NPI is 1013917053. If possible, I request that the

information be - provided . in electronic format. My email address is
adam@nicholsonrevell.com.

If you have any questions about handling this request, please feel free to contact
me at (706) 722-8784. Thank you in advance for your assistance.

AWK/mme



Brenda James

From: Bryan Kost

Sent: Monday, June 11, 2012 11:01 AM

To: Brenda James

Subject: please log - FW: Orangeburg Nursing Home/UniHealth Post-Acute Care FOIA
Attachments: Ltr to Bryan Kost SCDHHS (06-11-12).pdf

Bryan Kost

SCDHHS

803.898.2865
803.429.3201
kostbr@scdhhs.gov

From: Adam King [mailto:adam@nicholsonrevell.com
‘Sent: Monday, June 11, 2012 10:02 AM

To: Bryan Kost

Subject: Orangeburg Nursing Home/UniHealth Post-Acute Care FOIA

Dear Bryan:

Attached please find my Open Records request for home office and facility cost reports from 2007-2011 for UniHealth
Post-Acute Care-Orangeburg, which formerly did business as Orangeburg Nursing Home. If you have any questions,
please give me a call. Also, if there is any fee associated with this request, kindly let me know what it is, and | will remit
the same.

Thanks in advance,

Adam King

£l

Confidentiality Note: This e-mail has been sent from a law firm. It may contain privileged and confidential
information and is intended solely for the use of the person(s) named above. If you are not an intended recipient, you
are hereby notified that any dissemination or duplication of this e-mail is prohibited and that there shall be no waiver of
any privilege or confidence by your receipt of this transmission. If you have received this e-mail in error, please notify
us by collect telephone call to the number indicated and forward the original message via U.S. Mail to the above
address. Thank you.



1 MOCHI Qa_mjm _Um—umajmjﬁ O._u = - Anthony E. Keck® Director’
w Health & Human Services Niki . Haleys Governor

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours S

Pages copied at $.10 per page ___ Pages S

Pages faxed at $.20 per page ____Pages $__

Shipping and Handling Costs $_

Other costs associated with the FOIArequest: _____ $_
Total >=._o_=>3 Due mn_u._.__._m“ S

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any
questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P.O. Box 8206 ¢ Columbia, South Caroiina 29202-8206
(803) 898-3202 » Fax (B03) 255-8235
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hony E. Keck, Director
ikki R. Haley, Governor

M.m South Carolina Department of @

Health & Human Services

June 28, 2012

Adam W. King, Esquire
Nicholson Revell, LLP
Gateway Professional Center
4137 Columbia Road
Augusta, Georgia 30907

Re:  FOIA Request — Medicaid Cost Reports for Orangeburg Nursing
Home/UniHealth Post-Acute Care

Dear Mr. King:

In response to your Freedom of Information Act request, enclosed you will find the 2008
hardcopy cost report you requested. There are no cost reports for 2006 and 2007 for this
facility due a change in ownership. The 2009, 2010 and 2011 cost reports were
previously sent to you by e-mail.

The documents provided are true and accurate copies of reports collected by the
Department in the regular course of its business.

Our expense for reproducing and mailing this information is nineteen and 30/100 dollars
($19.30). Please make the check payable to the Department of Health and Human
Services and send it to:

Department of Health and Human Services
Department of Receivables

Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, SC 29202-8297

I hope this information is helpful to you. Please contact me if there are any questions.
Sincerely,

)
N\N\ Ry

Richard G. Hepfer
Deputy General Counsel

RGH/h
Enclosures
cc: Lynette D. Wilson, Receivables

Office of General Counsel
P.0. Box 8206 * Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2795 » Fax (803) 255-8210



