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To: <stensland@scdhhs.gov>
Date: 4/20/2012 12:31 PM

Subject: Request under FOI AP R MD NSN

Requesting copy of contract between SCDHHS and Robertsons Lab for Medicaid

From: Kirk Peterson <kpeterson@vcgsc.com> .Nm omH<m|U

. Deparim,
eyewear 8Nt of Heg|
Would like to know when the next RFP would be let OFFICE OF ._._D m Human Servicas
Thank you, Kirk Peterson, President, VCGsc DIRECTOR

*Kirk Peterson, President” .

*Telephone: (803) 749-3930 or 1 (888) 579-2273 [CARE]*
*Mobile: (803) 622-9313*

*Fax: (803) 749-3944*

*E-mail: **kpeterson@vcgsc.com* <kpeterson@vcgsc.com>
*Web Site: www.visioncaregroupsc.com®

*Vision Care Group Inc [VCG]* .

*PO Box 771*

*Irmo SC 29063*

**Qur middle name is CARE...** *
* our commitment is CARING*
* about YOUR Eye Heaith™

Warning: The information contained in this e-mail and any accompanying documents, constitutes confidential information which
belongs to the Vision CARE Group, Inc. [VCGsc]. This information is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named
below. If you are not the intended recipient of this information, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or
the taking of any action in reflance on this information is strictly prohibited. This e-mail may contain patient Protected Health
Information [PHI] that is required by law fo be disclosed and maintained in a secure and confidential manner. Re-disclosure may be
prohibited. Failure to maintain confidentiality or re-disclosure without authorization could result in penalties as described in State and
Federal law. If you have received this e-mail in error, please immediately notify us by telephone at (803) 749-3930 or 1 (888)
579-2273 to arrange for its retum to us. Thank You for your cooperation.
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From: Jan Polatty

To: Brenda James

Date: 4/20/2012 12:37 PM
Subject: Fwd: Request under FOI

Attachments: Request under FOI
Here it is....thanks, Jan.
>>> Jeff Stensland 4/20/2012 12:33 PM >>>

Please log

Jeff Stensland
SC DHHS
(803) 898-2584
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TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours
Pages copied at $.10 per page ‘ Pages
Pages faxed at $.20 per page — Pages

Shipping and Handling Costs

Other costs associated with the FOIA request:

4 L €0 BH &BH &

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs .
South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297 .

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any
questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P.O. Box 8206 « Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-3202 - Fax (803) 255-8235
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- __
From: Jean Maner
Sent: Tuesday, May 29, 2012 9:54 AM
To: kpeterson@vcgsc.com
Cc Mike Cannon; Janet Bell
Subject: FOIA Request

Dear Mr. Peterson:

This email is in response to your FOIA request dated 4/20/2012 regarding the contract between SCDHHS and Robertsons
Lab for Medicaid Eyewear. The contract you inquired about ends December 31, 2013. A new solicitation should be
issued no later than March 2013 to ensure a new contract can be put in place prior to the expiration of the current
contract. The Materials Management Office requests we send the contract information out by the link listed below, so
you can be assured to have all amendments. I hope that this answers your questions fully.

http://webprod.cio.sc.gov/SCSolicitationWeb/contractSearch.do?solicitnumber=5400000503

Thank you

Robert M. Cannon (by jym)



