From: Zavoras, Catherine <cZavoras@aging.sc.gov>
To: Finance Help, Aging <financehelp@aging.sc.gov>
CC: Watson, Dale <dwatson@aging.sc.gov>
Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov>
Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>
Date:  10/23/2014 1:13:40 PM
Subject:  RE: Lowcountry Services PRF # 4for September 2014

No reimbursement for legal services has been requested.

Tony and Ruchelle: | will continue keeping you all in the loop on these so that you will know that | am doing due
diligence and making you all aware that the AAAs are NOT compliant with the Older Americans Act. They are NOT
spending their legal service dollars.

Cat

Catherine S. Zavoras

State Legal Services Developer

South Carolina Lieutenant Governor's Office on Aging
Office of the State Long Term Care Ombudsman
1301 Gervais Street, Suite 350

Columbia, SC 29201

Phone 803-734-9983, Fax 803-734-9988
czavoras@aging.sc.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This electronic email may contain information that is privileged, confidential, and/or otherwise protected from
disclosure to anyone other than its intended recipient(s). Any dissemination or use of this electronic mail or its contents by persons other than the
intended recipient(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply email so
that we may correct our internal records. Please then delete the original message.

From: Finance Help, Aging

Sent: Thursday, October 23, 2014 1:06 PM

To: Van Cleave, Jennifer; Pondy, Kevin; Rivers, Denise; Zavoras, Catherine; Wolf, Anne; Shavo, Katherine
Cc: Ellison, Ruchelle; Kester, Tony

Subject: FW: Lowcountry Services PRF # 4for September 2014

Please review the attached PRF(s) for your programs. The PRFs can also be found on the groupshare
(K:N\PSA\\PRFs\\FY15\\Lowcountry).

Please send an email once approved or rejected stating reason for rejection. Please respond within three (3) business
days.

From: Hank D Amundson [mailto:HDAmundson@Ilowcountrycog.org]
Sent: Thursday, October 23, 2014 12:31 PM

To: Finance Help, Aging

Cc: Sherry Smith

Subject: FW: Lowcountry Services PRF # 4for September 2014

Please find Lowcountry's Services PRF for September attached.
Hank Amundson - Interim AAA/ADRC Director

HDAmundson@lowcountrycog.org
843-726-5536
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843-726-5165-fax

From: Sherry Smith

Sent: Thursday, October 23, 2014 12:27 PM

To: Hank D Amundson

Subject: Lowcountry Services PRF # 4for September 2014

Hank,
Please forward this request to financehelp@aging.sc.gov.

Thanks.
Sherry

Sherry G. Smith
Finance Director

Lowcountry Council of Governments
PO Box 98

Yemassee, SC 29945

(843)726-5536
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