Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov>
Rivers, Deniseriversd@aging.sc.gov
9/17/2014 6:18:49 PM

Re: VA Payment

Has there been any work on the older outstanding invoices.
Sent from my iPad

On Sep 17, 2014, at 5:28 PM, "Rivers, Denise" <riversd@aging.sc.gov> wrote:

Hi Tony,
Hope you are having a good evening. Just wanted to let you know that another payment for $39,616.54 was posted
today on VIS. All for Dorn for July.

Denise
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