9/29/2016 11:23:35 AM
RE: insurance docs

| waited to send so | could adjust - | added one more to the exec line.

Thanks Athenal!

From: Christensen, Athena

Sent: Thursday, September 29, 2016 8:16 AM
To: Taylor, Richele

Subject: RE: insurance docs

Richele,
The governor is counted on your tort policy. Please let me know if you need to adjust the number.
Thanks,
Athena

Athena S. Christensen, CPCU
Underwriting Field Services Manager
Insurance Reserve Fund

1201 Main Street, Suite 500
Columbia, SC 29201

803-737-0023

803-988-0310 or 803-737-0393 (Fax)
achristensen@irf.sc.gov

From: Taylor, Richele

Sent: Wednesday, September 28, 2016 5:04 PM
To: Christensen, Athena

Subject: insurance docs

Athena,
Attached are the next set with the data processing sheet and list, and also the auto policy. On the
data processing, | included all electronics including TV (media room). We are right at $51,000. | don't

know if that is a range choice so if we need to stay at $50,000 that is fine.

On the last spreadsheet with employees, | did not include the Governor in the total. Is that right? | can


mailto:Taylor,%20Richele
mailto:achristensen@irf.sc.gov

send that once you confirm. | did include students (3) all of whom are at USC. We sometimes have a
summer intern from Harvard in the mix from a program there but usually still at 3 number. | know
school matters. We have no volunteers.

Richele
From: ECOS-XR-SH119@bcbad.state.sc.us [mailto:ECOS-XR-SH119@bcbad.state.sc.us]
Sent: Wednesday, September 28, 2016 4:46 PM

To: Taylor, Richele
Subject: Scanned from ECOS-XR-SH119

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you using a Xerox Multifunction
Printer.

Attachment File Type: pdf, Multi-Page

Multifunction Printer Location: SH 119
Device Name: ECOS-XR-SH119



