From: Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov>
To: Philpott, Katie <KatiePhilpott@gov.sc.gov>
CC: Pisarik, Holly <HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov>
Date:  12/1/2015 12:36:55 PM
Subject:  FW: Gov. Haley's Office

For our records.

From: Jewell Hollingsworth [mailto:jhollingsworth@co.laurens.sc.us]
Sent: Tuesday, December 01, 2015 12:29 PM

To: Schimsa, Rebecca

Subject: RE: Gov. Haley's Office

Rebecca,

In reference to the conversation that we had before Thanksgiving, the reason my credit has doctor bills and the car
owed. The doctor bills come from where | had breast cancer and was not able to pay as quickly and they wanted
them to be paid. | am a single mother and | had to take care of my family. | continue to make payments but they still
appear on my credit. The vehicle that was repossessed was when my mother lived with me and she wanted to have
something bigger and once we got the vehicle she decided she did not want to live with me anymore, and she didn’t
want to keep the vehicle, therefore | had to let it go back to the finance company.

If you need anything else please let me know.

Jewel Hollingsworth

From: Schimsa, Rebecca [mailto:RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, December 01, 2015 11:09 AM

To: jhollingsworth@co.laurens.sc.us

Subject: Gov. Haley's Office

Thank you, Jewel.

Rebecca S. Schimsa

Deputy Legal Counsel

Office of Governor Nikki R. Haley
0: 803-734-6068 | C: 803-429-4561
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