Kevin L. Bryant <KevinBryant@scstatehouse.gov>
J J GentryJJGentry@scsenate.gov

3/6/2017 4:26:18 PM

Re: Senate acct.

Thank you for your help JJ,
Can this documentation be email?
Sent using OWA for iPhone

From: JJ Gentry

Sent: Monday, March 6, 2017 11:52:50 AM
To: Kevin L. Bryant

Cc: Danny Varat

Subject: RE: Senate acct.

Lieutenant Governor:

Y ou are prohibited from using funds from one officia position to pay for the expenses of another official position. In
other words, you are prohibited from using funds from your Senate campaign account to pay for the expenses of your
Lieutenant Governor position. Y ou would need to use funds from your Lieutenant Governor campaign account to pay
for expenses related to your Lieutenant Governor position. | do not know if you were able to resolve whether you were
going to create a Lieutenant Governor campaign account. This issue might be a good reason why you need such an
account. You can transfer the contributions from your Senate campaign account to your Lieutenant Governor campaign
account, if you have written permission to do so from the contributors. Y ou could then use those funds to pay for
expenses related to your Lieutenant Governor position. If you have any other questions, please feel free to contact me.

y 5

J. J. Gentry

South Carolina Senate
Ethics Committee
Counsel

205 Gressette Building
P.O. Box 142
Columbia, SC 29202
(803) 212-6412 (O)
(803) 212-6499 (F)
JJGentry @scsenate.gov

From: Kevin L. Bryant

Sent: Sunday, March 05, 2017 5:23 PM
To: JJGentry

Cc: Danny Varat


mailto:Kevin%20L.%20Bryant%20%3CKevinBryant@scstatehouse.gov%3E
mailto:JJGentry@scsenate.gov
mailto:JJGentry@scsenate.gov

Subject: Senate acct.

JJ, | hope you find this email doing good.

I've been asked to speak at several republican party conventions around the state. There are several in one day
and the only way | can get to all of them isto have a chartered flight.

Can | use my Senate campaign account to pay for this?

Sent using OWA for iPhone



