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South Carolina Association of
Residential Care Homes

July 19, 2013

Mr. Bryan Kost

SC Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8206

Columbia, South Carolina 29202

Dear Bryan:

Under the South Carolina Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request a copy of the
OSCAP program documents. We are requesting:

The OSCAP Manual

The CLTC waiver amendment

A copy of the questions and answers from CMS regarding the waiver
A copy of the OSCAP contract

BN e

Please call me at 803-951-3296 or email at mbailey@scarch.org if you have any questions.
Thank you. .

Sincerely,

Melody Bailey, Executive Director

1721 Sunset Boulevaed, Suite D, Lexingron, South Carolin v 20072
Phowe 8039515290 Fax 803930213 Emil sechiiscarchoorg Website www.searchorg



Health & Human Services Nikki R. Haleys Governor

)'(Soulh Ca.rOIina Department Of Anthony E. Keck+ Director

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours $

Pages c;opied at $.10 per page Pages $_

Pages faxed at $.20 per page . Pages $_ -

Shipping and Handling Costs $_

Other costs associated with the FOIA request: $_
Total Amou;1t Due SCDHHS: $_

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact ' . should you have any
questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P.0. Box 8206 » Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) B98-3202 » Fax (803) 255-8235
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Health & Human SerViceS Nikki R. Haley, Governor

)'( m cafdimmpammd Anthony E. Keck, Director

August 06, 2013

Melody Bailey, Executive Director
4721 Sunset Boulevard, Suite D
Lexington, South Carolina 29072

Dear Ms. Bailey:

This is in response to your request for information from the South Carolina Department
of Health and Human Services (SCDHHS) pursuant to the South Carolina Freedom of
Information Act (FOIA) dated July 19, 2013 and received by SCDHHS on July 23, 2013.
Enclosed is the information that was requested for OSCAP Program.

Our expense for extracting this information is Fifteen and 80/100 dollars ($15.80).
Please make the check payable to the Department of Health and Human Services and
send it to:

Department of Health and Human Services
Department of Receivables

Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, SC 29202-8297

Thank you for your request. If you have any questions, you may contact Ms. Brenda

Hyleman at (803) 898-2687.
Sincerely,
Constance D. Holloway Z
Assistant General Counsel —.
CDH/Ib

cc: Lynette Wilson

Enclosures

Office of General Counsal
P.O. Box 8206 - Columbia, South Carolina 20202-8206
{803) 898-2795 » Fax (803) 266-8210



Brenda James

\

From: Linda Boyer

Sent: Tuesday, August 06, 2013 12:44 PM

To: Annmarie McCanne

Cc: Brenda James

Subject: RE: FOIA #031 Final Response Letter
Attachments: FOIA 031 Final Response Letter_08_06_2013.pdf
Hi Annie,

Someone placed FOIA #031 information in Bryon’s box after Pete reviewed and signed off on blue sheet.
There was no final response letter attached, so | created one, Attorney, Constance Holloway reviewed the
data and approved the final response letter.

Letter is attached, please close your files accordingly.

Thanks
Linda Boyer

From: Annmarie McCanne

Sent: Monday, August 05, 2013 4:17 PM

To: Linda Boyer

Subject: RE: RE: Update on FOIA Request# 00031 (Due Today)

Hey —1 did receive this today for Pete’s review, however | have not had a chance to get with him and | am out tomorrow.
Can this wait until Wed?

From: Linda Boyer

Sent: Monday, August 05, 2013 8:47 AM

To: Annmarie McCanne

Subject: RE: Update on FOIA Request# 00031 (Due Today)
Importance: High

Good Morning Annie,

I hope you had a great weekend! This is a follow-up on FOIA #31. It's due today (08/05/2013) and I was
checking in for an update.

I have attached a copy of the original FOIA request.

Thanks!

SC Dept of Health & Human Services
Office of General Counsel

1801 Main Street

Columbia, SC 29201

Phone: (803) 898-2669

Fax: (803) 255-8210

Email: boyer@scdhhs.gov

“Learn to appreciate what you have, before time makes you appreciate what you had”
1






