Kester, Tony

'‘Sharon Seago' <sseago@centralmidlands.org>
1/18/2013 11:44:43 AM

RE: Waiting Lists - Corrected

I'll try to get some clarification for all of us.
Thanks.

Tony

From: Sharon Seago [mailto:sseago@centralmidlands.org]
Sent: Friday, January 18, 2013 11:34 AM

To: Kester, Tony

Subject: RE: Waiting Lists - Corrected

| believe this spreadsheet is mandated by the state, so | believe that would be your call; however, it does show a false
cost when it is backed out. Maybe it would be better to not back out NSIP for either.

From: Kester, Tony [mailto:kester@aging.sc.gov]
Sent: Friday, January 18, 2013 11:26 AM

To: Sharon Seago

Subject: RE: Waiting Lists - Corrected

Could the same not be done for HCBS since we can claim that for NSIP?

From: Sharon Seago [mailto:sseago@centralmidlands.org]
Sent: Friday, January 18, 2013 11:07 AM

To: Kester, Tony

Subject: RE: Waiting Lists - Corrected

On Ethel's spreadsheets NSIP is backed out of Title Ill before the unit rate is calculated.

From: Kester, Tony [mailto:kester@aging.sc.gov]
Sent: Friday, January 18, 2013 10:57 AM

To: Sharon Seago

Subject: RE: Waiting Lists - Corrected

Sharon,

Why is the HCBS rate higher than the Title I11?

From: Sharon Seago [mailto:sseago@centralmidlands.org]
Sent: Friday, January 18, 2013 10:25 AM

To: Kester, Tony

Subject: FW: Waiting Lists - Corrected

From: Sheila Stahlberger [mailto:sri08@sc.rr.com]
Sent: Friday, January 18, 2013 10:21 AM

To: Sharon Seago

Cc: Wendy Jones (Wendy Jones)

Subject: Waiting Lists - Corrected
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Sharon,

In 111B transportation, we will run out of I1IB funds during the month of February. To continue to serve I1IB
transportation through June, we need an estimated additional 110,000 passenger miles x .64 per mile = $70,400 11IB
total; Federal 85% = 59,840; State 5% = $3,520; Local match = $7,040

| estimate we will still have 80 remaining on our Home-Delivered Meals waiting list after we get add some new folks
in for a couple of grants we just received. From February through June, we would need 8,320 Meals. At the HCBS rate
this would be $51,334. At the 1lIC2 rate, this would be $40,829 total; Federal 85% = $34,705; State 5% = $2,041;
Local Match = $4,083.

We also currently have 20 folks on our Waiting list for Congregate Meals due to the lack of transportation funds. But
we need to first make sure we can fund transportation for the people we are currently serving.

Thanks for asking and let me know if you need anything else!
Sheila

From: Sharon Seago [mailto:sseago@centralmidlands.org]

Sent: Thursday, January 17, 2013 4:48 PM

To: Angi Connor; Lynn Stockman; Ichristison@Icrac.com; Sheila Stahlberger
Subject: Waiting Lists

Please send me your waiting lists numbers and the dollar figure to eliminate for the remainder of the fiscal year.
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