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Brenda James - FOIA for Dental APD
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From: "Bonnie Loomis" <bonnie@pincusloomis.com> ,

To: <kostbr@scdhhs.gov> %ﬁﬁmuﬂdﬁ

Date: 11/4/2009 3:33 PM ; .

Subject: FOIA for Dental APD NOV 0 4 2009

CC: <boucher@scdhhs.gov> Department of Health & Human Services
OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR

Bryan & Steve -

Pursuant to the South Carolina Freedom of Information Act, I request a copy (preferably electronic,
if available) of the Advance Planning Document (APD) submitted by SC DHHS to the Centers or
Medicare and Medicaid Services in regard to the Dental Administrative Services contract awarded
to Doral Dental. Please feel free to email or call with any clarifying needs in this regard.

Many thanks -

Bonnie

Bonnie Drake Loomis, Esquire
Pincus Loomis Law Firm

3306 Millwood Avenue
Columbia, SC 29205
803-261-3280 (cell)
803-576-3755 (office)
803-253-8676 (fax)
www.pincusloomis.com

Unless you have entered into an attorney/client relationship with this office by retaining the
services of Pincus Loomis Law Firm, the information contained in this email is not protected by the
attorney/client privilege and does not give rise to an attorney/client relationship. Any advice
contained herein is given in the context of general information and may not pertain to your specific
situation. Paying for a consultation with Pincus Loomis Law Firm does not create an attorney/client
relationship and does not create an attorney/client privilege.

ATTORNEY/CLIENT PRIVILEGED

The preceding e-mail message (including any attachments) contains information that may be
confidential, be protected by attorney/client or other applicable privileges, or constitute nonpublic
information. It is intended to be conveyed only to the designated recipient(s). If you are not an
intended recipient of this message, please notify the sender by replying to this message and then
delete if from your system. Use, dissemination, distribution, or reproduction of this message by
unintended recipients is not authorized and may be unlawful.
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TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours
Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages

Shipping and Handling Costs

Other costs associated with the FOIA request:

¥ P P & H e,

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs
South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297
Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any
questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P.O. Box 8206 « Columbia, South Carolina 28202-8206
(803) 898-2503 « Fax (803) 255-8235
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From: Bryan Kost

To: Deirdra Singleton

Date: 12/2/2009 10:45 AM

Subject: Re: Fwd: Response to Log #000207

Thanks - I will forward it to her.

--—---Original Message-—--

From: Deirdra Singleton

Cc: Nikole Boland <haltiwan@scdhhs.gov>
To: Bryan Kost <KostBR@scdhhs.gov>

Cc: Felicity Myers <MYERSFC@scdhhs.gov>

Sent: 12/2/2009 10:30:45 AM
Subject: Fwd: Response to Log #000207

Bryan,
here is the Dental APD that Bonnie requested. thanks

Deirdra T. Singleton

Deputy Director/General Counsel
Department of Health and Human Services
1801 Main Street

Columbia, South Carolina 29201
(803)898-2795

(803)255-8210 fax



