
From: Grant, Pamela <grantp@aging.sc.gov>
To: Finance Help, Aging <financehelp@aging.sc.gov>
CC: Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov>

Rivers, Denise <riversd@aging.sc.gov>
Wolf, Anne <awolf@aging.sc.gov>

Date: 9/17/2014 2:14:45 PM 
Subject: RE: SC Invoice August 2014

The invoice has been approved.

-----Original Message-----
From: Finance Help, Aging
Sent: Tuesday, September 16, 2014 4:40 PM
To: Grant, Pamela
Cc: Kester, Tony; Rivers, Denise; Wolf, Anne
Subject: FW: SC Invoice August 2014

Please review the attached PRF(s) for your programs. The PRFs can also be found on the groupshare
(K:\PSA\PRFs\FY15\Experience Works).

Please send an email once approved or rejected stating reason for rejection. Please respond within three (3) business
days.

-----Original Message-----
From: Tonia_Saunders@experienceworks.org [mailto:Tonia_Saunders@experienceworks.org]
Sent: Monday, September 15, 2014 4:50 PM
To: Finance Help, Aging
Cc: Melissa_Galdos@experienceworks.org; jessica_hounshell@experienceworks.org; Andrew_Jaime@experienceworks. 
org
Subject: SC Invoice August 2014

Please find attached SC State invoice for August 2014.

(See attached file: SC AUGUST 2014 INVOICE.pdf)(See attached file: INKIND REPORT - SC - AUG 2014 SUB 15. 
xlsx)(See attached file: PR260 - SC AUG 2014 SUB 15.pdf)

Thanks!

Tonia Saunders ,BSA,CWDP
Assistant Director of Program Operations (East) Experience Works Inc.
4334 West Central Avenue Suite 206
Toledo, Ohio 43615
703-682-2273 (Direct Line)
1-866-397-9757 EXT 2273

(Embedded image moved to file: pic30382.gif) "Improve the lives of older people through training, community service, and 
employment."
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