11/25/2014 2:07:16 PM
Re: FW: draft agreement

Sure, I will look it over. Any of the proposed dates work for me.

Charlie

Charles L.A. Terreni

Terreni Law Firm, L.L.C.

1508 Lady Street

Columbia, South Carolina 29201
Telephone (803) 771-7228

Fax (803) 771-8778

CONFIDENTIAL COMMUNICATION
The information contained in this message may contain legally privileged and confidential information intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, distribution or duplication of this message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please
notify us by telephone or email immediately at the address above and return the original message to us or destroy all printed and
electronic copies. Your cooperation would be greatly appreciated.

On Tue, Nov 25, 2014 at 1:45 PM, Bedsole, Coretta D < > wrote:
Good Afternoon All,

We have received the paperwork from the Central Carolina Community Foundation. Nanette and |
had a preliminary discussion this morning and recommend we have a meeting to flesh out details.
Nanette will review the document prior to our meeting and be prepared to walk us through a
series of questions to expedite the discussion. Charlie, would you be willing to also review the
document and coordinate with Nanette? | think this needs the input of our two great legal minds.
See attached. Please take a look at the following dates and let me know what would work for
you for a meeting.

Thanks and Happy Thanksgiving,
Coretta

December 5that 2:00 p.m.


mailto:Terreni,%20Charles%20L.A.%20%3Ccharles.terreni@terrenilaw.com%3E
mailto:cbedsole@aarp.org
mailto:dan.jones@twcable.com
mailto:Chuck.Claunch@duke-energy.com
mailto:kester@aging.sc.gov
mailto:nsedwar@regstaff.sc.gov
mailto:charles.terreni@terrenilaw.com
http://www.terrenilaw.com
mailto:cbedsole@aarp.org

e December 11th at 3:00 p.m.
e December 16th at 10:00 a.m.
e December 16th at 1:30 p.m.
e December 17th at 10:00 a.m.

e December 17th at 3:00 p.m.

Coretta Bedsole | AARP South Carolina | Associate State Director
Advocacy
1201 Main Street | Suite 1720 | Columbia, SC 29201

Office: | Cell:

Real Possibilities in

South Carolina

From: Heather Sherwin [mailto: 1
Sent: Tuesday, November 18, 2014 3:46 PM

To: Bedsole, Coretta D

Subject: draft agreement

Coretta,

The attached pdf has yellow dialogue bubbles indicating what needs your attention in order for us
to prepare the final agreement.

Once you have the answers, give me a call and Iwill customize the agreement -filling in blank
lines. 1will send the final agreement to you to have the appropriate people sign. Once signed you
return to us for signature and then we provide you with a copy. The dollars may be transferred
whenever is convenient for Duke Energy. We're happy to provide wire transfer instructions if that
is preferable to writing a check.

We're just so honored and thrilled to be working with YOU and also to be part of such a great
project for our seniors in South Carolina.
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Thank you,

Heather

Heather Sherwin

Central Carolina Community Foundation
2711 Middleburg Drive, Suite 213 | Columbia, SC 29204

) I ©) 1 (F) I heather@yourfoundation.org
www.yourfoundation.org

Celebrating 30 More Years of Giving

In celebration of our 30th Anniversary, we have launched , an initiative
devoted to giving back via multiple "Acts of Giving" thoughout the year. Follow the hashtag
#WhyIGiveSC to view our acts. Then, view our to learn how you too can get involved

and give back to the community.

Learn more:

The information contained in this email is privileged and confidential information intended for the use of the individual or firm named above. If the reader of this message is
not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copy of this communication is strictly prohibited. We cannot accept liability for any
loss or damage caused by software viruses. Information contained herein is not a substitute for expert legal, tax or other professional advice tailored to your specific
circumstances, and may not be relied upon as such. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately and then delete it. Thank you.
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