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Elizabeth Hutto - Disproportionate Share Hospital Audit Contract Inquiry

From: Kristina Mulholland <kmulholland@input.com> wmﬁmmﬁdﬂma
To: "wells@scdhhs.gov" <wells@scdhhs.gov> .

Date: 6/3/2009 7:49 AM JUN 0 3 7009
Subject: Disproportionate Share Hospital Audit Contract Inquiry

OFFICE OF THE DIREGTOR
Good Morning William,

| spoke with you yesterday in regards to the Disproportionate Share Hospital (DSH) Audit contract with Clifton
Gunderson. | am interested in obtaining a copy of the current contract via an open records request, and you said
that | could email my request directly to you and you would send it to who it needs to get to.

Please let me know if you need any additional information to complete my request.
Thank you for your assistance. Have a wonderful day!

Kind Regards,
Kristina

Kristina Mulholland

Analyst, Social Services & Health Care

INPUT

11720 Plaza America Drive, Suite 1200, Reston, Virginia 20190
Direct: 703-707-4059; Fax 703-707-6201
kmulholland@input.com

http://www.input.com

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and are intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to which they are addressed. If you are not the intended recipient or the person
responsible for delivering the email to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this
email and any such files in error and that any use, dissemination, forwarding, printing or copying of this
email and/or any such files is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error please
immediately notify postmaster@input.com and destroy the original message and any such files.
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Bepurtment of Health-amd-Humorn Serbices
Mark Sanford - Emma Forkner

Governor Director

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request # :

“The South Carolina Départient of Healtha nd Human Services has Teceived and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing-this information is as

follows:
Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours $
Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages $
Pages faxed at $.20 per page ‘Pages $
‘Shipping and Handling Costs $
Other costs associated with the FOIA request: $ .

Total Amount Due SCDHHS: $

Please remit the above amount to the followirig address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



Oees

State of South Qarolina

Hepartment of Health and Humem Sertrices

Mark Sanford Emma Forkner
Governor Director

July 13, 2009

Ms. Kristina Mulholland, Analyst,
Social Services & Health Care
INPUT
11720 Plaza America Drive, Suite 1200
Reston, Virginia 20190

Dear Ms. Mulholland:

Enclosed you will find the information and the billing for processing your recent
Freedom of Information Act request from our office.

| hope this information is helpful to you. If you should have any questions, please
contact Patty Larimore at (803) 898-2595.

Sincerely,

oA LML

~ William L. Wells, CPA
Deputy Director

WLW/sbp

Enclosures

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



State of South Carolina

Bepartment of Health and Hinum Berbices

Mark Sanford Emma Forkner
Governor Director
July 13, 2009
TO: Ms. Kristina Mulholland, Analyst, Social Services & Health Care

INPUT
FROM: William L. Wells, CPA

Deputy Director

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request # 666

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour 1 Hours $10.00
Pages copied at $.10 per page 239 Pages $23.90
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages $__
Shipping and Handling Costs $_6.50_
Other costs associated with the FOIA request. $

Total Amount Due SCDHHS: $40.40

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

_ mmm oo:ﬁmoﬁ Brand cSmS at Amowv 898-1040 should you have any questions.

July 13, 2009
\< m_o:mEa Date

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



