
From: Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov>
To: Robert Faturechi <Robert.Faturechi@propublica.org>
CC: Pisarik, Holly <HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov>

Adams, Chaney <ChaneyAdams@gov.sc.gov>
Date: 1/29/2016 5:47:19 PM

Subject: RE: Cost Letter

We’ll get it to you on Monday.
 
From: Robert Faturechi [mailto:Robert.Faturechi@propublica.org] 

Sent: Friday, January 29, 2016 12:50 PM

To: Schimsa, Rebecca

Cc: Pisarik, Holly; Adams, Chaney

Subject: RE: Cost Letter
 
Hi all. Got the documents. Would you mind sending over an electronic copy of the Nov. 13, 2014 email from Katie Philpott to 
Mark Nix from 2:06 pm that has a table in it. The printout got cut off when you printed it. 
 
Robert Faturechi
Reporter, ProPublica
Desk: 917-512-0216
Cell: 213-271-7217
robert.faturechi@propublica.org

From: Robert Faturechi

Sent: Friday, January 29, 2016 9:28 AM

To: Schimsa, Rebecca

Cc: Pisarik, Holly; Adams, Chaney

Subject: RE: Cost Letter

Thanks. The check should arrive Monday. 
 
Robert Faturechi
Reporter, ProPublica
Desk: 917-512-0216
Cell: 213-271-7217
robert.faturechi@propublica.org

From: Schimsa, Rebecca [RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov]

Sent: Friday, January 29, 2016 9:23 AM

To: Robert Faturechi

Cc: Pisarik, Holly; Adams, Chaney

Subject: Cost Letter

Please see attached.
 
 
 
Rebecca S. Schimsa
Deputy Legal Counsel
Office of Governor Nikki R. Haley
O: 803-734-6068 | C: 803-429-4561
 
One SC Flood Relief Fund – www.onescfund.org
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