From: Kester, Tony
To: 'Pompi, Jeanette' <Jeanette.Pompi@Colliers.com>
Date:  4/15/2014 9:47:18 AM
Subject:  RE: SC Lt. Gov. Office (Tower at Gervais) - April RENT

We mailed the check last Tuesday.

Tony Kester

Aging Director

South Carolina Lieutenant Governor's Office on Aging
1301 Gervais Street, Suite 350

Columbia, SC 29201

Phone 803-734-9910, Fax 803-734-9886
kester@aging.sc.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This electronic email may contain information that is privileged, confidential, and/or otherwise protected from
disclosure to anyone other than its intended recipient(s). Any dissemination or use of this electronic mail or its contents by persons other than the
intended recipient(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply email so
that we may correct our internal records. Please then delete the original message.

From: Pompi, Jeanette [mailto:Jeanette.Pompi@Colliers.com]
Sent: Tuesday, April 15, 2014 9:41 AM

To: Kester, Tony

Subject: SC Lt. Gov. Office (Tower at Gervais) - April RENT

Good morning, Tony! Can you advise if the April rent payment has been sent? | ran an AR yesterday and your April
rent is still showing unpaid - total due: $11581.88.

Please let me know asap - | have to send a report to InRel tomorrow and send a status update.
Many thanks. Have a great day!
JNet

Accelerating Success!

Jeanette K. Pompi

Collections and Insurance | South Carolina
Dir +1 803 401 4226 | Main +1 803 254 2300
Fax +1 803 401 4226
jeanette.pompi@colliers.com

Colliers International
1301 Gervais Street, Suite 600 (29201)
PO Box 11610 | Columbia, South Carolina 29211 | USA

www.colliers.com
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