
From: Roberts, John <robertsj@aging.sc.gov>
To: Danny VaratDannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov

Date: 12/7/2017 3:54:11 PM
Subject: Re: Stationary Order -Business Cards

Danny. The printer said that if they can't have them done before 11 would you want them to ship to his 
address in Anderson?

From: Danny Varat 
Sent: Thursday, December 7, 2017 3:47:41 PM
 
To: Roberts, John
 
Subject: Re: Stationary Order -Business Cards 
 
​Until 11


From: Roberts, John 
Sent: Thursday, December 7, 2017 3:43 PM
 
To: Danny Varat
 
Subject: Re: Stationary Order -Business Cards 
 
How long will the LG be there on Tuesday?

From: Danny Varat 
Sent: Thursday, December 7, 2017 3:39:04 PM
 
To: Roberts, John
 
Subject: Re: Stationary Order -Business Cards 
 
​Yes, unless Tuesday is at all possible. LG will be in Columbia that day and not again until after Christmas. Let's 
just do the best we can. Thanks


DV


From: Roberts, John 
Sent: Thursday, December 7, 2017 3:36 PM
 
To: Danny Varat; Catherine McNicoll
 
Subject: Re: Stationary Order -Business Cards 
 
Danny, I am out of the office sick today but I just spoke to printer. They will have a proof for us tomorrow and 
we get that approved, then they can have the cards to us in hand by next Wednesday. Is that good?

From: Danny Varat 
Sent: Thursday, December 7, 2017 3:31:19 PM
 
To: Roberts, John; Catherine McNicoll
 
Subject: Re: Stationary Order -Business Cards 
 
​Please proceed. Please send me an ETA, and please ask them to rush, if possible.


From: Roberts, John 
Sent: Thursday, December 7, 2017 3:08 PM
 
To: Catherine McNicoll
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Cc: Danny Varat
 
Subject: Re: Stationary Order -Business Cards 
 
Hey Catherine and Danny....

I sent over the estimate and you were gonna get back to me if I should proceed but I didn't hear back. Yes 
they will invoice the LG personally.

So let me know if you would like to proceed. I can resend the estimate!

From: Catherine McNicoll 
Sent: Thursday, December 7, 2017 12:46:34 PM
 
To: Roberts, John
 
Cc: Danny Varat
 
Subject: RE: Stationary Order -Business Cards 
 
Good Afternoon John, I wanted to follow up and see if we had an estimated time for when these cards would come 
in. Also to confirm that the invoice is to the Lieutenant Governor personally, not the office. Thank you.
 
Best Regards,
Catherine McNicoll
Director of Legal & Legislative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicoll@SCStatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)
 

From: Danny Varat 
 
Sent: Wednesday, November 29, 2017 6:58 AM
 
To: Catherine McNicoll 
Subject: Re: Stationary Order -Business Cards
 
​Yes. He said he's proceeding.

From: Catherine McNicoll
 
Sent: Tuesday, November 28, 2017 5:28 PM
 
To: Danny Varat
 
Subject: RE: Stationary Order -Business Cards 
 
Danny, did you ever respond to John Roberts?
 
Best Regards,
Catherine McNicoll
Director of Legal & Legislative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicoll@SCStatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)
 

From: Danny Varat 
 
Sent: Thursday, November 16, 2017 8:30 AM
 
To: Roberts, John <robertsj@aging.sc.gov>; Catherine McNicoll <CatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov>
 
Subject: Re: Stationary Order -Business Cards
 
​I'll get back to you today. Thanks

From: Roberts, John <robertsj@aging.sc.gov>
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Sent: Thursday, November 16, 2017 8:23 AM
 
To: Catherine McNicoll
 
Cc: Danny Varat
 
Subject: RE: Stationary Order -Business Cards 
 
Here is the estimate for those cards. Shall I proceed?
 

From: Catherine McNicoll [mailto:CatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov] 
 
Sent: Wednesday, November 15, 2017 2:55 PM
 
To: Roberts, John <robertsj@aging.sc.gov>
 
Cc: Danny Varat <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov>
 
Subject: Stationary Order -Business Cards
 
Good Afternoon John, Please find attached a mock-up of the changes the Lieutenant Governor would like to his next 
order of business cards. He will be paying out of pocket for them. Can you please prepare the order and get two 
boxes.
 
Best Regards,
Catherine McNicoll
Director of Legal & Legislative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicoll@SCStatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)
 
From: LTGOVOFFICE@SCSENATE.gov [mailto:LTGOVOFFICE@SCSENATE.gov] 
 
Sent: Wednesday, November 15, 2017 3:06 PM
 
To: Catherine McNicoll <CatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov>
 
Subject: Message from BIZHUBC224
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