
From: Catherine McNicoll <CatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov>
To: 'Roberts, John' <robertsj@aging.sc.gov>

Deborah Aiken <DeborahAiken@scstatehouse.gov>
CC: Danny Varat <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov>

Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>
Date: 3/12/2018 9:55:55 AM

Subject: RE: Estimate ( Note Card & Envelope )

John, please proceed with the order of 250 in all black ink. Please give the invoice to us so the Lieutenant Governor 
can pay it. Thank you.
 
Best Regards,
Catherine McNicoll
Director of Legal & Legislative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicoll@SCStatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)
 

From: Roberts, John [mailto:robertsj@aging.sc.gov] 
 
Sent: Friday, March 09, 2018 3:37 PM
 
To: Deborah Aiken 
Cc: Danny Varat ; Catherine McNicoll ; Ellison, Ruchelle 
Subject: FW: Estimate ( Note Card & Envelope )
 
Here is a new estimate. Note there is an estimate on there for 250 and 500….with everything in all black ink.
 
From: James Padgett [mailto:james@anotherprinterinc.com] 
 
Sent: Friday, March 9, 2018 3:14 PM
 
To: Roberts, John <robertsj@aging.sc.gov>
 
Subject: Re: Estimate ( Note Card & Envelope )
 
John,
  I adjusted the estimate for the Black Ink envelopes only. If you need anything else, please do not hesitate to let 
me know.

 
--

Thanks,

James Padgett
Another Printer, Inc.
10 Bush River Court
Columbia, SC 29210
SAGE # 226451
 
(803) 798-1380
(803) 626-1492 Fax
1-888-689-6399 Toll-Free
james@anotherprinterinc.com
http://www.anotherprinterinc.com
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