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| Brenda James - FW: FOI Request : Cost Reports and Rate Sheets

Pegel}

From: "Jonathan Duvall" <JDuvall@uhs-pruitt.com> .
To: <jamesbr@scdhhs.gov> Wmﬂﬁﬁﬁg

Date: 1/16/2007 2:20 pm

Subject: FW: FOI Request : Cost Reports and Rate Sheets ~ JAN 1 ¢ 2007
Department of Health & Human Services
OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR

From: Jonathan Duvall
Sent: Wednesday, January 10, 2007 5:38 PM

To: 'kostbr@dhhs.state.sc.us'
Subject: FOI Request : Cost Reports and Rate Sheets w . \\F\
D 1
Bryan, d ﬁ Dx\g\ﬁ
~©
| would like to request a copy of the 9/30/06 cost reports, all _ { %\_\S.
supplemental information used in preparing the cost reports, and the ‘

10/1/06 rate calculation and desk audit for the following facilities:

Fairfield HealthCare - Ridgeway, SC

Laurel Baye of Orangeburg - Orangeburg, SC
Laurel Baye of Blackville - Blackville, SC
Laurel Baye of Williston - Williston, SC

Laurel Baye of Greenville - Greenville, SC

| would prefer to have the documents electronically but if that is not
possible, a paper copy mailed to my attention at 1626 Jeurgens Court;
Norcross, GA 30093 is sufficient. Please contact me either by e-mail or
phone at your convenience to arrange payment.

Thank you for your help.

Jonathan Duvall
Financial Analyst
UHS-Pruitt Corporation
678.533.6751 direct



Mark Sanford
Govemor

State of South Cearolina
Bepurtment of Healthy and Hinmen Serfrices

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

Robert M. Kerr
Director

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours
Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages

Shipping and Handling Costs

Other costs associated with the FOIA request: :

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Please contact

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

$______
S
S
$_____

$

|

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services

Post Office Box 8297 .
Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

should you have any questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



K@N o2

State of South Caroling
Bepartment of Health and Humon Berbices

Mark Sanford Robert M. Kerr
Governor Director

January 19, 2007

UHS-Pruitt Corporation
Attn: Jonathan Duvall
1626 Jeurgens Court
Norcross, Georgia 30093

Dear Mr. Duvall:

In response to your recent Freedom of Information Act request, enclosed you will find the
information you requested along the billing for processing this information.

| hope this information is helpful to you. If you should have any questions, please contact
Jacqueline Wilson-Barnes at (803) 898-1040.

William L. Wells, CPA
Deputy Director

WLW/jwb

Enclosures

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



Mark Sanford
Governor

State of South Carolina
Bepartment of Health and FHumn Serbices

January 19, 2007
TO: UHS-Pruitt Corporation
Attn: Jonathan Duvall
FROM: William L. Wells, CPA
Deputy Director

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request # 462

Robert M. Kerr
Director

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour 11/2 Hours

Pages copied at $.10 per page 234 Pages

Pages faxed at $.20 per page 7 Pages

Shipping and Handling Costs
Other costs associated with the FOIA request:

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

$15.00

——

$23.40

- $1.40

—

$5.60
$
$45.40

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services

Post Office Box 8297
Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact Jacqueline Wilson-Barnes at (803) 898-1040 should you have any

I o ol

Signature

1]

Date

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235

1/15 )07



