
From: Taylor, Richele
To: Haltiwanger, Katherine <KatherineHaltiwanger@gov.sc.gov>

Date: 10/27/2016 1:47:14 PM
Subject: RE: Numbers and Nucor

It is updated.  Through end of day Friday the non-sponsor number was $61,541.77.  Through Tuesday evening the 
 number for non-sponsorships was - $69,366.77.  The new number is $72,419.77.  It shows entries through 10/24.  I 
would say that from the time the money hits to when it processes is not real time though
 
Richele
 
From: Haltiwanger, Katherine 

Sent: Thursday, October 27, 2016 12:08 PM

To: Taylor, Richele

Subject: RE: Numbers and Nucor
 
The spreadsheet says October 20 at the top…it also has HSB listed as pledged and then it has paid…do you 
know if it is updated before we put it in the staff notes?
 
Thanks,
Katherine
 
 
 
From: Taylor, Richele 

Sent: Thursday, October 27, 2016 8:45 AM

To: Haltiwanger, Katherine

Subject: Fwd: Numbers and Nucor
 

Richele K Taylor
Chief Legal Counsel
Office of the Governor
South Carolina
Direct 803-734-8465
 
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Ebony Perkins <Ebony@yourfoundation.org>

Date: October 27, 2016 at 8:13:57 AM EDT

To: "Taylor, Richele" <RicheleTaylor@gov.sc.gov>, JoAnn Turnquist <JoAnn@yourfoundation.org>

Subject: RE: Numbers and Nucor

Hi Richele,
Thank you. That would be a huge help.  Please view the updated list of donors. I will send you another 
list in the near future.
 
Best Regards,
 
Ebony L. Perkins, MPA
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Donor Relations Manager
 
Central Carolina Community Foundation
2711 Middleburg Drive, Suite 213  I  Columbia, SC 29204
803.978.7816 (O)   I  803.799.6663 (F)   I   ebony@yourfoundation.org
www.yourfoundation.org
 
Learn more:
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