
From: Moloney, John M <John.M.Moloney@boeing.com>
To: Amy Duffyaduffy@scprt.com
CC: Veldran, KatherineKatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov

Date: 7/21/2014 1:28:28 PM
Subject: RE: Invoice - First Gentelman's Invitational

It should have been paid by now...so sorry. Let me check intothis and get back toyou.

JMM

From: Amy Duffy [mailto:aduffy@scprt.com]
Sent: Monday, July 21, 2014 11:03 AM
To: Moloney, John M
Cc: katherineveldran@gov.sc.gov
Subject: FW: Invoice - First Gentelman's Invitational

Hi John,

Just a reminder ~~ I know how crazy busy things are for you ~~ so thought I would re-send this invoice in case I got 
lost in the shuffle.

Best,
Amy

Amy Duffy
Chief of Staff 
SCPRT

From: Amy Duffy
Sent: Friday, June 20, 2014 9:23 AM
To: john.m.moloney@boeing.com
Cc: katherineveldran@gov.sc.gov
Subject: FW: Invoice - First Gentelman's Invitational 

John,

Please see the attached invoice.

Appreciate your support!

Best, Amy

Amy Duffy
Chief of Staff 
SCPRT
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From: Amy Duffy
Sent: Wednesday, March 26, 2014 9:57 AM
To: john.m.moloney@boeing.com
Subject: Invoice - First Gentelman's Invitational
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