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Brenda James

From: Kim Cox RECEIVEF:

Sent: Wednesday, December 10, 2014 9:03 AM
To: Brenda James ..
Subject: FW: FOIA Response DEC 112014
Attachments: SKMBT_C75414120912590.pdf Department of Hoalth & Human 5
& Ruman Services
OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR
Brenda,
I believe this is a FOIA request. Would you please log and distribute?
Thanks,
Kim
Kimon . ) . - i:ll.ﬂﬂ C-ili:lml C . Q
N €
Strategic Stakeholder Relations, Office of Chief of Staff ealt O ﬁg’g’.?ﬂ g ).
COXKIM@scdhhs.gov
803.898.4439

1801 Main Street
Columbia, SC- 29201
www.scdhh.gov

Healthy Connections and the Healthy Connections logo are trademarks of South Carolina Department of Health and
Human Services and may be used only with permission from the Agency.

From: Annie Wilson [mailto:awilson@capconsc.com)
Sent: Tuesday, December 09, 2014 1:37 PM

To: Kim Cox

Subject: FW: FOIA Response

Kim,
Could you please forward this email to Constance Holloway or provide her email address?

Ms. Holloway,

As a follow up to our previous request, would you please provide the claims paid data for codes A0431 alone for
calendar years 2009-2014?

Annie W. Wilson

General Counsel & VP of Government Affairs
Capitol Consultants

P.O. Box 1763/Columbia, SC 29202
803.252.1087/803.318.4573 (¢)

WwWw, capconsc. com
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Anthony E. Kecke Director
Nikki R. Haleys Governor

'( South Carolina Departmentof &5
) Health & Human Services

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours $

Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages $_

Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages $_

Shipping and Handling Costs $_

Other costs associated with the FOIA request: $_
Total Amou;1t Due SCDHHS: $____

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs
South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services

Post Office Box 8297
Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any
questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P.0. Box 8206 * Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-3202 » Fax (803) 255-8235



Nikki Haley
Christian L Soura -
P.0, Box 8206 <Columbia, SC 29202
www.scdhhs.gov

December 22, 2014

Ms. Annie W, Wilson
General Counsel

Capitol Consultants, Inc.
PO Box 1763

Columbia, SC 29202

Dear Ms. Wilson:

This is in response to your request for information from the South Carolina Department of
Health and Human Services (DHHS) pursuant to the South Carolina Freedom of Information Act
(FOIA) dated December 9, 2014 and received by DHHS on December 9, 2014. Enclosed is a
spreadsheet for the claims paid data code A0431 for calendar years 2009-2014.

Our expense for extracting this information is Ten and 49/100 dollars ($10.49). Please make the
check payable to the Department of Health and Human Services and send it to:

Department of Health and Human Services
Department of Receivables

Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, SC 29202-8297

Thank you for your request. If you have any questions, please feel free to contact me at 803-
898-0062.

Sincerely,
ra Cf
e Aol
{ aagdaitem,t ;"‘»,;M.\.ﬂuﬂ
L O

Constance Holloway
Assistant General Counsel

Enclosure

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services Better care. Better value. Better health,



/\103 ¢/30”'/

Healthy Connectaons }

Nikid Hatey
Christian L. Soura ".., .
PO, Boic 8205 Colurnbia, SC 29202
www.scdbhs.gov
December 22, 2014
Ms. Annie W, Wilson
General Counsel
Capitol Consultants, Inc.
PO Box 1763
Columbia, SC 29202
Dear Ms. Wilson:

This is in response to your request for information from the South Carolina Department of
Health and Human Services (DHHS) pursuant to the South Carolina Freedom of Information Act
(FOIA) dated December 9, 2014 and received by DHHS on December 9, 2014. Enclosed is a
spreadsheet for the claims paid data code A0431 for calendar years 2009-2014,

Our expense for extracting this information is Ten and 49/100 dollars ($10.49). Please make the
check payable to the Department of Health and Human Services and send it to:

Department of Health and Human Services
Department of Receivables

Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, SC 29202-8297

Thank you for your request. If you have any questions, please feel free to contact me at 803-
898-0062.

Sincerely,
S
f‘,,‘, -‘-‘;.:2'_'-'];-','&:« LAt - NS
Constance Holloway
Assistant General Counsel

Enclosure

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services Better core. Better value. Better health.



