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Webmail
3rdreconusmc@embarqmail.com

Re: [letters] storm water fee

From : Robert E Williams
<3rdreconusmc@embarqmail.com>

Subject : Re: [letters] storm water fee

To : David Lauderdale
<dlauderdale@islandpacket.com>

Wed, Mar 02, 2016 10:46 AM

heavy rain storm and drive through Colonial Heights subdivisi i

' ' on and see what it looks
like. I only wish that I would have kept the pictures from before and I would send
them to you and maybe you would have another outlook on this problem. I am sorry

Robert E. Williams

From: "David Lauderdale" <dlauderdale@islandpacket.com>
To: "Robert E Williams" <3rdreconusmc@embargmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 1, 2016 4:51:10 PM

Subject: Re: [letters] storm water fee

Have you seen all this information on the stormwater utility fee? Perhaps it will
answer some of your questions:

On Tue, Feb 23, 2016 at 11:15 AM, Robert E Williams
< > wrote:

itting this article in hope that all Property Owners/Residents who live in
flsgan:n%:?rgountgy reads it. When I received my renewal statement neediess to saey:j
I was upset as it went from $25.01 the previous year to $54.50. When I contact
the Tax Office I never received a proper answer back. I _requested the msatFItIEI:ave
concerning the increase and also vlvhergni;s tg!: rr:\:sng\\,/egrgg\vs \?viceanu\s;veev;Zt al e rain

j i that I live. The ditc

2::3(;;)? zﬁlg;nvsvgt‘etrhfi? IFvsgeks after. You can bet your dollar _to a dc?ughrr‘lu‘ts that kt;rte
city doesn't have this problem. Again where is the Money going or in who's pocket.

1 3/79/7016
httn//mail centurvlink nef/'zimhm/h/nrintmeﬁgaoe‘hd=?.7707’). D el
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I have checked with other residents in my area and there tax was $16.00. Why is
mine $54.50???? I also discussed this with friends from other parts of the County
and their taxes are different also. in my opinion we need to have some thing put
out in writing to justify these charges or refuse to pay them.

I took it one step further and notified the Govenor's Office on this and some other
matters of concern in our area and action is going to be taken in a matter of time.
Approxmately 2 weeks. In my opinion this should have been voted on by the
Resident's/ Property Owners.

Robert E. Williams
1972 Pulaski Dr.
Beaufort, S.C. 29906

David Lauderdale, senior editor/columnist
The Island Packet and The Beaufort Gazette
843-706-8115

or
Twitter: - Facebook:

http:/mail.centurylink. net/zimbra/h/printmessage?id=272972 3/29/2016
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BEAUFORT COUNTY TRANSPORTATION COMMITTEE

104 Industrial Village Road, Building #3, 29906
Post Office Drawer 1228, Beaufort, SC 29901-1228
Telephone: 843-255-2700 Facsimile: 843-255-9420
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Committee Members: Beaufort County Staff Support:
Kraig Gordon, Chairman Robert McFee, PE, Division Director
Bob Arundell, Joe DeVito Construction, Engineering & Facilities

J. Craig Forrest, Mark McCain
Steve Miller, Joseph Stroman
Stephen Wilson

March 17, 2016

SgtMaj (Ret) Robert E. Williams

1972 Pulaski Drive

Beaufort, SC 29906

Dear SgtMaj Williams:

First and foremost, we thank you for your service to our Country.

The Beaufort County Transportation Committee and similar committees in other counties are
primarily tasked to the maintenance of county roads. Unfortunately, Pulaski Drive is not a
County road but a State route.

Your letter was discussed at our recent meeting and we were assured that your letter has been

forwarded to Mr. Wendell Mulligan, Resident Maintenance Engineer, SCDOT for his action and
response.

We appreciate your time in contacting us for assistance.

Sincerely,

Foraie Cooedome,.

Kraig-Gordon
Chairman, Beaufort County Transportation Committee

KG/mjh

cc: Wendell Mulligan
BCTC Members

BCTC/ltrWilliams-PulaskiDr



