Kester, Tony

'Chris Bickley' <cbickley@lowcountrycog.org>
2/19/2013 9:48:39 AM

RE: Jasper County Council on Aging

Correct

From: Chris Bickley [mailto:cbickley@lowcountrycog.org]
Sent: Friday, February 15, 2013 2:47 PM

To: Kester, Tony

Cc: Marvile Thompson; Sherry Smith

Subject: RE: Jasper County Council on Aging

Tony-
So | can be sure, you are agreeing to $10K up front from the CoA, not their original offer of $20K up front, correct? CB

From: Kester, Tony [mailto:kester@aging.sc.gov]
Sent: Thursday, February 07, 2013 5:26 PM

To: Chris Bickley
Subject: RE: Jasper County Council on Aging

Chris,

| think to require more would put Jasper COA out of business. | will accept the proposal, but would like a monthly
accounting of the repayment. LCOG needs to schedule regular monitoring visits to assure compliance with their
contract.

Tony

From: Chris Bickley [mailto:cbickley@lowcountrycog.org]
Sent: Thursday, February 07, 2013 4:45 PM

To: Kester, Tony

Subject: FW: Jasper County Council on Aging

Tony-
How is this coming?
Chris

From: Chris Bickley

Sent: Wednesday, January 30, 2013 12:48 PM
To: Kester, Tony

Cc: Marvile Thompson; Sherry Smith

Subject: Jasper County Council on Aging

Tony-

| received the attached proposal this morning to repay the $74,375 of Title Ill transportation funds, which would
provide for repayment in approximately four and a half years. | believe it is a sincere commitment by the CoA board
and done with some assistance from Jasper County Council. |1 do have concern about the initial payment's effect on
the CoA's financial strength. With your approval I'm prepared to accept the proposal as submitted, however I'd like
you to consider an initial payment as low as $10,000, which, at most, would add less than a year to the repayment
schedule. In any case, we've started the $1,000 monthly repayment with the CoA's November invoice.

Let me hear from you soon.
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Thanks,

Chris Bickley
Lowcountry COG
843-726-5536



