6/27/2002 1:42:57 PM
RE: DMV transfer

That is fine, Carol. Will you make sure that there are no remaining balances in our appropriated 1201 account? | had
already discussed this with Don.

----- Original Message-----

From: Pappas, Carol

Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2002 11:57 AM
To: Bowers, Gregory

Cc: Adams, Marcia S.; Royal, Don
Subject: DMV transfer

Don says Marcia has authorized we use the balances in DMV state 1201 against the deficit in state contributions. So
instead of transferring all of the balances to one account at DMV, the total will be transferred to state contributions
account. ok?
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