
From: Finance Help, Aging <financehelp@aging.sc.gov> 
To: Grant, Pamela <grantp@aging.sc.gov>
CC: Wolf, Anne <awolf@aging.sc.gov>

Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>
Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov>

Date: 11/18/2014 11:45:47 AM 
Subject: FW: SCSEP and Beyond

Attachments: Payment Request #1.pdf

Please review the attached PRF(s) for your programs. The PRFs can also be found on the groupshare 
(K:\\PSA\\PRFs\\FY15\\Goodwill).

Please send an email once approved or rejected stating reason for rejection. Please respond ASAP.

From: Robyn Campbell [mailto:RCampbell@GoodwillSC.org]
Sent: Tuesday, November 18, 2014 11:35 AM
To: Finance Help, Aging
Cc: Becky Godbey; Shelly Francis
Subject: SCSEP and Beyond

Good morning,

The SCSEP and Beyond payment request is attached. Thanks!

Robyn H Campbell, CPA
Controller

Goodwill Industries of Upstate/Midlands SC & SCVIA
115 Haywood Road
Greenville, SC 29607
Office: 864-351-0139
Email: rcampbell@goodwillsc.org

Building self-sufficiency through the power of work.

www.goodwillsc.org

This message is confidential, intended only for the named recipient(s) and may contain information that is privileged, 
attorney work product or exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient(s), you 
are notified that the dissemination, distribution or copying of this message is strictly prohibited. If you receive this
message in error, or are not the name recipient(s), please notify the sender at either the e-mail address or telephone 
number above and delete this e-mail from your computer.
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