
From: Chris Wells <uniform@itsclassics.com>
To: Veldran, KatherineKatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov

Date: 3/25/2013 9:07:45 AM
Subject: RE: First Gentleman's GOLF HATS Invoice from ITS Classics, Inc

Katherine...

Hats are scheduled for completion by April 12th.
They may be done earlier than that but can't guarantee it.

Chris

Chris Wells
-Director of Operations- 
UNIFORM WORK & SPORT 
29E Hunter Road 
Hilton Head Island, SC 29926 
Office: (843) 681-4133, ext 232 
Store: (843) 681-3002 
Fax: (843) 689-2239
Email: uniform@itsclassics.com

From: Veldran, Katherine [mailto:KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Friday, March 22, 2013 11:34 AM
To: Chris Wells
Subject: RE: First Gentleman's GOLF HATS Invoice from ITS Classics, Inc

When will these be completed?
Are they able to be shipped here?

From: Chris Wells [mailto:uniform@itsclassics.com]
Sent: Friday, March 22, 2013 11:32 AM
To: Veldran, Katherine
Subject: First Gentleman's GOLF HATS Invoice from ITS Classics, Inc 
Importance: High

Katherine,

Attached is the invoice for the hats.

Here is the contact info for payment.
Liz Valentine
Operations Administrator/Accounting Officer
ITS Classics, Inc &~ Uniform, Work & Sport-
29-D Hunter Road.
Hilton Head Island, SC 29926 
accounting@itsclassics.com 
843-681-4133 x221 
843-689-2239 Fax

Thanks!
Chris

Chris Wells
-Director of Operations- 
UNIFORM WORK & SPORT 
29E Hunter Road
Hilton Head Island, SC 29926
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