
From: Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov> 
To: Ellison, Ruchellerellison@aging.sc.gov

Date: 5/10/2014 4:35:38 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Credit Card Payment Confirmation

Attachments: Invoice-112278.pdf 
ATT00001.htm

Tony Kester
Aging Director
South Carolina Lieutenant Governor's Office on Aging 
1301 Gervais Street, Suite 350 
Columbia, SC 29201
Phone 803-734-9910, Fax 803-734-9886
kester@aging.sc.gov

Begin forwarded message:

From: LivingDot <billing@livingdotsupport.com> 
Date: May 9, 2014 at 5:26:31 AM EDT 
To: Tony Kester <kester@aging.sc.gov> 
Subject: Credit Card Payment Confirmation

Dear Tony Kester (Office On Aging),

This is a payment receipt for Invoice 112278 sent on 05/04/2014 

ONE - bgtime.org (05/09/2014 - 06/08/2014) $14.90 USD

Sub Total: $14.90 USD
Credit: $0.00 USD
Total: $14.90 USD

Amount: $14.90 USD
Transaction #: 6161311769
Total Paid: $14.90 USD
Remaining Balance: $0.00 USD
Status: Paid

You may review your invoice history at any time by logging in to your client area. 

Note: This email will serve as an official receipt for this payment.

LivingDot, Inc.
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