11/10/2014 9:06:06 PM
FW: Approval Needed - Victoria Lewis

Below is the email about the delivery date of Nov 7th.
Let's connect tomorrow on options.
KV

From: Victoria Lewis [mailto:vlewis@scprt.com]
Sent: Thursday, October 30, 2014 11:20 AM
To: Veldran, Katherine

Cc: Amy Duffy

Subject: FW: Approval Needed - Victoria Lewis

We caught a goof with the colors in the india pin (gold and green were reserved in proof #12).
The attached pin is the one on order with delivery date of Friday, Nov. 7th.

Victoria Lewis

Executive Assistant to the Director
SC PRT

(803) 734-0166

vlewis@scprt.com

From: Courtney H [mailto:sales@thelapelpinjunction.com]
Sent: Thursday, October 30, 2014 11:08 AM

To: Victoria Lewis

Subject: Approval Needed - Victoria Lewis

Hello Victoria,

Per your request we have attached a Full Color Proof of your design.
Please review this proof(s) and your pertinent order information and reply back to us with your
approval to proceed.

Name: Victoria Lewis
Customer Phone #: (803) 734-0166
Email: vlewis@scprt.com
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Quantity: 100

Product: Lapel Pin

Type: Cloisonne

Size: 1"

Backing: 1 Butterfly Clutch

Plating: 18k Gold

Epoxy: No

Colors: White, Black, 2745C, 144C, 361C, 072C Proof Number: 12

Order Total: $271.00

Please note that your order will be ready to ship in about 10 business days and we will ship it via 2-
Day Air.

DUE TO THE EXTREME VOLUME OF TRADING PINS ORDERED BETWEEN THE DATES OF
(JUNE 1 and JULY 31) THERE WILL BE NO DELIVERY GUARANTEES IMPLIED OR OFFERED
BETWEEN THIS TIME PERIOD

We will charge the order to the credit card number provided.

All price quotes valid for 7 days unless otherwise stated in email above. Estimated production times
do not begin until final artwork approval and payment have BOTH been received.

Please note that all pins are measured longest point to longest point.
Due to the custom nature of the product we manufacture, all sales are final and once an order has
been placed it may not be canceled for any reason.

By replying to this email and giving your approval to start production of this order, you are stating that
you have thoroughly checked and reviewed the proof and acknowledge that it is free of errors and is
ready for manufacturing.

Courtney H

855-471-6746
www.thelapelpinjunction.com
sales@thelapelpinjunction.com

Like Us on Facebook!
http:/mww.facebook.com/LapelPinJunction

On 10/30/2014 10:36 AM, Victoria Lewis wrote:

> Ok - will call you once | receive the email.

>

> Victoria Lewis Executive Assistant to the Director SC PRT (803)
> 734-0166 vlewis@scprt.com
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