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Brenda James - Fwd: PERS Providers in SC

.__n._n.un...au Teeshla Curtis WMOMH<MU

Brenda James
Date: 12/19/2011 12:46 PM

. o DEC 19 2011
Subject: Fwd: PERS Providers in SC
- Department of teatt 5 Human Services
OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR
Please log as F@IA to Sam.
Thanks,
Teeshla

>>> "Bob Burns" <bob@myinstantcare.com> 12/14/2011 1:58 PM >> >
To whom it may concern,

Would it be possible to get a list of all Medicaid Home and Community-Based Waiver PERS providers in SC?
Name of organization and Phone number is all we need.

Bob Burns

President, Instant Care, Inc.
C: 760-470-3104
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. em MO_&&\_ ﬁm_d_mjm UmUmEﬁmSﬂ Oﬁ. = Anthony E, Keck® Director
M Health & Human Services Nikki R. Haleys Governor

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:
Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour . Hours $
mmmm_m copied at $.10 per page Pages S
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages $_.
Shipping and Handling Costs $ |
Other costs associated with the FOIA request: 3

Total Amount Due SCDHHS: $_

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs.

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact __should you have any
questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P.O. Box 8206 » Columbia, South Caralina 29202-8206
(803) 898-3202 - Fax (803) 255-8235
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Brenda James - Ref Log 231 N\o/m_ 2+ QNN\

From:; Teeshla Curtis

To: Brenda James

Date: 12/20/2011 3:29 PM

Subject: Ref Log 231

CcC: Chaini Demas; Jon Tapley; ROY SMITH

Attachments: Response to FOIA request.PDF

Brenda,
Below is the response for Log 231.
Teeshla

>>> Chaini Demas 12/20/2011 3:24 PM >>>
Good afternoon Mr. Burns!

Per your request, attached is a letter from Jon Tapley and a list of PERS providers enrolled with SC Medicaid.
Also, enclosed is an invoice for processing costs. Please contact Jon Tapley if you have any questions.

Thank you very much,

Chaini C. Demas
Bureaw Of Long Ternw Care
PO Bow 8206 (29202)

1801 MavwuStyaal
Cotlewmilio, 5C 29201

{(C} (803) 898-2709

(F) (8032)255-8209

deinasc@sedlifis.gov

Happiness Keeps you Sweet,
Trials Kgep you Strong,
Sorroews Keep yor Human,
Fatlures Rgep you Humble,
Stuccess Keeps you Glowing,
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Brenda James - Logs 227 & 231

From: Teeshla Curtis

To: Brenda James

Date: 12/20/2011 3.07 PM
Subject: Logs 227 & 231

Brenda,
Logs 227 & 231 are the same. I am associating the request with Log 231 (that was the first one I got).

Thanks,
Teeshla
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‘mmoc.a._ ﬁmga _Uﬂumﬁs‘ﬁ:mgu = . Anthony E. Keck, Director
V Health & Human Services NIkki R. Haley. Gavernor

December 20, 2011

Mr. Bob Burns

Instant Care

Post Office Box 246
Pauma Valley, CA 92061

Dear Mr. Bums:

We received your email request for a listing of Personal Emergency Response System
(PERS) providers enrolled with SC Medicaid and their phone number. The attached
listing contains the names and phone numbers of all PERS providers in the state of
South Carolina. -

Enclosed is an invoice in the amount of $10.20 for processing costs associated with
your request.

Thank you for your inquiry, if you have further questions or concems you may contact
me at 803-898-2702.

Sincerely,




PERS Provider Listing

12/15/2011

Name of Provider

Instant Care Inc

Caringhelpers

Community Life Link LLC
Affordable Medical Home Supply
Tri State Medical Supplies

The Mobility Center

Comfort Keepers

Lifeline Pilot Club

Family Care Medical Supply
Darlington Personal Service
Safeguard Medical Alarms Inc
ADP Security

Bryant Pharmacy And Supply
Pilot Club Orangeburg Foundatio
Phillips Lifeline

Home Helpers

Home Helpers Direct Link

Ace Medical LLC

Lifeline of Fairfield

Oconee Medical Center Life
Home Helpers and Direct Link
Home Helpers Direct Link
Springs Memorial Hospital
Emergency Partner Systems

Life Alarm Services

CYPRESS MEDICAL SUPPLY

ADT Security Services Inc
Anmed Health Lifeline
Lifestation Inc.

All Medical Inc.

Interim Healthcare of Greenville
Evening Pilot Club of Sumter
Carealliance Lifeline

Lifeline

HELP SERVICES INC

Health Related Medical Equipment

Service

Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emner. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer, Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp, Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer, Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers, Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer, Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer, Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer. Resp. Sys.
Pers. Emer, Resp. Sys.

Phone Number
(877) 424-4050
(864) 233-1799
(843) 464-4307
(864) 295-3965
(864) 579-2899
(843) 692-8001
(843) 656-1056
(803) 254-2673
(843) 756-6869
(843) 393-1344
(800) 849-2302
(864) 297-3124
(864) 224-0711
(803) 534-1717
(800) 451-0525
(803) 765-9096
{803) 520-6802
(843) 536-0330
(803) 633-2107
(864) 885-7600
(864) 848-7129
(843) 837-3041
(803) 286-1474
(877) 778-9890
(706) 854-9818
{803) 435-9927
(877) 456-1787
(864) 261-4095
(800} 446-3300
(803) 779-2011
(864) 627-1200
(803) 778-9656
(843) 720-8440
(864) 255-9300
(803) 808-4357
(864) 366-0602




mmog.: gﬁm gﬁmaﬂm:ﬁ Q_n @ Anthony E. Kecks Director
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TO:
FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The moE: Om..o_sm Department of Heatlth and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA _,mncmmﬁ The cost for processing this information is as

follows: _

Staff processing time at $10.00 um.. hour |~I| Hours al..\lD
Pages copied at $.10 per page | 2 : Pages «.IFN.DI
Pages faxed at $.20 per page __ . Pages el.lm
Shipping and Handling Costs o ._ $

Other costs associated with the FOIA request: .
‘Total Amount Due SCDHHS: - : wﬁb
Please remit the above amount to-the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs.

South Carolina Department of Heaith and Hyman mmz_omm
Post Office Box 8287 .

Columbia, South Carolina 28202-8297

Please contact 3 %Wm.m\c\r ﬁ\lw..m:.\\ ¢ A¢ __ should you have any
questions. _ _ ' \

12/ 20/ 1/

Date:

Finance and Administration
P.0O, Box 8208 - Columbia, South Carolina 28202-8206
{803) 8983202 * Fax (803) 255-8236




