5/4/2016 2:48:11 PM
FW: Signed Settlement & Release - 3700 Forest Drive

See below and attached re. parking lot in Richland County from the Flood.

From: Stenson, Kim [mailto:Kstenson@emd.sc.gov]

Sent: Wednesday, May 04, 2016 11:14 AM

To: Schimsa, Rebecca

Subject: FW: Signed Settlement & Release - 3700 Forest Drive

Rebecca,

This incident is finally closed. Funds disbursed, release signed, and letter to Richland County
outlining their POD responsibilities delivered.

Regards,

Kim

From: Maynard, Danielle

Sent: Wednesday, May 04, 2016 10:21 AM

To: Mark Williams <MWilliams@forestacres.net>; gsealy@forest-acres.org; Warren Harley
<HarleyW@rcgov.us>; Rick Owen <rowen@naiavant.com>

Cc: Stenson, Kim <Kstenson@emd.sc.gov>; Avant, David <David.Avant@admin.sc.gov>
Subject: Signed Settlement & Release - 3700 Forest Drive

All:
Please find attached the signed Settlement & Release. If you have any questions, please do not
hesitate to contact me.

Danielle

Danielle W. Maynard, Esquire

Legal Counsel

South Carolina Emergency Management Division
2779 Fish Hatchery Road

West Columbia, South Carolina 29172

Email: dmaynard@emd.sc.gov

Office: 803-737-8584

Cell: 803-667-2180
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