Roberts, John <robertsj@aging.sc.gov>

Danny VaratDannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov

Catherine McNicollCatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov

12/8/2017 10:18:45 AM

FW: Business Cards - Kevin L. Bryant Proof (Lt. Gov. - State of SC - Office of Aging)
KBryant.pdf

Here is the proof for the LG cards. Please let me know if thisis approved and we will get them processed.

From: Steve Kelly [mailto:steve@anotherprinterinc.com]

Sent: Friday, December 8, 2017 9:58 AM

To: Roberts, John

Subject: Re: Business Cards - Kevin L. Bryant Proof (Lt. Gov. - State of SC - Office of Aging)

Hey John,
I've made the requested changes for you to review.

On Fri, Dec 8, 2017 at 9:50 AM, Roberts, John <roberts @aging.sc.gov> wrote:
Can you make that bottom line “Not Paid for....” Smaller?

From: Steve Kelly [mailto:steve@anotherprinterinc.com]

Sent: Friday, December 8, 2017 8:52 AM

To: Roberts, John <roberts @aging.sc.gov>

Subject: Business Cards - Kevin L. Bryant Proof (Lt. Gov. - State of SC - Office of Aging)

John,

| have attached the proof of the business cards for the Lt. Governor. Please look it over carefully and let me know if itis OK to
proceed with production. Also, please review your specs below and confirm they are what you had ordered.

Quantity: 1,000

Finished Size: 2" x 3.5"

Stock: 80# Cover

Ink Colors: Raised PMS 873 Gold, Raised Black

*IMPORTANT**

This email and the following attachments are provided as a PROOF of your order. [tisSEXTREMELY IMPORTANT that you
check for spelling, grammar and proper position of each item and indicate your approval with your replied email. Production will not
begin without an emailed approval. Another Printer will not be held responsible for any mistakes or corrections after we receive

your approval response \Without exception!
All requested changes/corrections must be made in writing either via fax, email or hard copy.

Thisproof isa Digital Representation. The colorsyou see on screen will not be represented
accurately in print. If colorsof a previous job must be matched please ensure YOU or
YOUR DESIGNER has built the colorsto match the previous print. A hard copy proof can
berequested and may incur additional chargesand will add delaysto the production time.
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Inkswill appear different on uncoated or non-white stocks. Because of differencesin
equipment, paper, monitor calibrations, and other conditions between color proofing and
production pressroom operation, a reasonable variation in color between this proof and

the completed job isto be expected. Acceptance of this proof representsyour approval.

Thanks,

Steve Kelly

Another Printer, Inc.

10 Bush River Ct.

Columbia, SC 29210
803-798-1380
888-689-6399
www.AnotherPrinterlnc.com
Like Us on Facebook
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